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Bill Smith puts a divot on a blade so that it will snap into 
place. (Photo by Tim Fleischer)

Bill Smith is donating three knives to the Cattlemen’s 
Ball on Oct. 16. (Photo by Tim Fleischer)

By Tim Fleischer

Editor-in-Chief

	 Bill Smith started mak-
ing knives more than a half-
century ago and began sell-
ing them when he was going 
to college.
	 “I needed a good knife 
and I couldn’t afford one, 
so I made one,” he told me 
while I was watching him 
work in his shop next to the 
historic Hendrickson-Cas-
key house on Center Circle 
where he and wife Bon-
nie live. He was putting the 
finishing touches on one of 
three knives he is donating 
to this year’s Cattlemen’s 
Ball, set for Oct. 16 at Ten-
roc Ranch.
	 His knives typically go 
for $2,000 each at the Auc-
tion, with auctioneer Bill 
Hall getting every penny 
he can, often pitting friends 
against each other in a bid-
ding war. The replica Musso 
Bowie knife he crafted and  
donated a few years back 
went for  almost $10,000 
alone.
	 With good reason. Smith 
spent a year researching 
the authenticity, history and 
drawings of the Musso Bow-
ie knife before making one 
that was displayed at The 
Alamo. He crafted a second 
one especially for the Cattle-
men’s Ball, bringing in top 
dollar.
	 Back to that first attempt, 
where creativity and inven-
tion are the child of neces-
sity. He needed a knife and 
was going to make one from 
a broken plow. “Dad’s fore-
man told me ‘you can’t make 
a knife of that. It’s too hard.’ 
Well, I did.”
	 He then began to make 
knives using blades from old 
planers and joiners, casting 
handles to put on them.
	 Smith found out that he 
could sell knives and make a 

little profit. He sold his first 
knife for $85, which was 
a lot more than the $50 he 
made working full time as a 
mechanic.
	 Bill wanted to be a 
preacher early in his life, but 
a friend told him he should 
be a teacher so he signed up 
as one of the first male stu-
dents at University of Mary 
Hardin Baylor. He went on 
to become an art teacher 
and spent most of his 32 
year teaching career in Bel-
ton.  	
	 He was teaching in Bel-
ton and living in the old 
Hendrickson-Caskey House 
when he met Bonnie, marry-
ing her in 1985. 
	 Bonnie was working at 
Salado schools in the ad-
ministration office and Bill 
teaching at Belton when they 
attended the first ever Cat-
tlemen’s Ball two decades 
ago.
	 The next year, Bill do-
nated his first knife to the 
auction and Bill Hall sold it 
for a heck of a lot more than 
$85. “I’ve been donating 
ever since,” he says. And the 
knives have brought tens of 
thousands of dollars to SEF 
coffers since then, where 
they go out to Salado gradu-
ates in the form of scholar-
ships and to Salado teachers 
in the form of Innovative 
Teaching Grants.
	 This year, Bill is donat-
ing three knives. Two are 
folding and one is a straight 
blade. He used ivory from 
a mammoth tusk found in 
Alaska for the body on two 
of them. Two of the knives 
will be sold in the live auc-
tion this year and one in the 
silent auction.
	 Tickets to the Cattle-
men’s Ball are $85 each and 
include a steak dinner from 
Johnny’s Steaks & Barbe-
cue. Bill Hall will gavel the 
Live Auction. Meanwhile 

the silent auction will go live 
at noon Oct. 14 and close at 
9 p.m. Oct. 16. Anyone can 
join the silent auction by reg-
istering at https://app.bidbea-
con.com/invite/#CPNYHW.  
	 In addition to two knives 
by Bill Smith, the live auc-
tion will feature two Super 
Bowl Tickets, a five-night 
stay at a gorgeous cabin near 
Estes Park in Colorado, a 

private dinner and concert 
with Brandon Rhyder (who 
will cook dinner for 20 
guests and then perform), 
and a swing designed and 
built by the Salado HS Ag 
department. 
	 Tickets are available on-
line at  https://buytickets.
at/saladoeducationfounda-
tion/574215 or at Century 21 
Bill Bartlett office.

Smith’s knives bring top dollar at Cattlemen’s 

	 Tickets are now available 
for purchase online for the 
long-awaited Jingle Walk, 
sponsored by the Salado La-
dies Community League. 
	 They may be purchased 
at centraltexastickets.com; 
click on the Salado Christ-
mas in October Jingle Walk 
event. 
	 This year’s event is sup-
ported by 23 of the local 
Salado businesses along Sal-
ado’s “Magic Mile.”
	 The Jingle Walk takes 
place on two days: noon-7 
p.m. Oct. 8 and 10 a.m.-4 
p.m. Oct. 9. Purchasing a 
Passport entitles you to shop 
on both days. 
	 Only 250 tickets will be 
sold. Each $25 Passport en-
titles you to collect a special 
gift from each participating 

business you visit. 
	 The passport will entitle 
the bearer to a gift from each 
of the following stores in 
Salado:  21 Main, Angelic 
Herbs Next Level Wellness, 
Christy’s of Salado, Con-
nie’s Gifts, Fletcher’s Books 
& Antiques, Greenfield’s 
Coffee & Tea House, H&H 
Home Decor and Gifts, Mud 
Pies Pottery, Salado Creek 
Antiques, Salado Glass-
works, Serendipity, Soeur, 
Sophistikatz Beads, Straw-
berry Patch, Sugar Shack, 
Susan Marie’s of Salado, 
The Collective Bartique, The 
Nature Co of Salado,  The 
Pixie Depot, The Rose and 
Bee, The Shoppes on Main, 
Uniquely Salado and Wild 
Texas Cowgirl.

	 Bell County Commis-
sioners enacted a 30-day 
burn ban effective until 10 
a.m. Oct. 27 after hearin 
from county Fire Marshal 
Chris Mahlstedt at their 
Sept. 27 meeting.
	 Chief Mahlstedt told 
Commissioners of the num-
ber of recent grassfires that 
have broken out across the 
county. He reported that the 
county saw 24 grassfires 
in the past week, including 
one on FM 1670 in Salado 
that required the East Side 
Strike teams to respond. A 
fire at Dana Peak required 
both the East Side and West 
side strike teams to respond, 
bringing firefighters from as 
far away as Copperas Cove.
	 “Conditions are ripe,” he 
said, adding that the recent 
dry spell coupled with heavy 
growth from a wet summer 
to provide a lot of fuel for 
grassfires.
	 Neighboring McLennan 
and Lampasas counties have 
recently issued burn bans as 
well.
	 The order comes with 
the ability for County Judge 
David Blackburn to rescind 
it depending upon whether 
there is sufficient rains in 
the coming days.
	 The order also allows 
Judge Blackburn to extend 
the burn ban if necessary.
	 The order comes with en-
forcement: a violation of the 

burn ban order is a Class C 
misdemeanor, punishable by 
a fine not to exceed $500.00. 
	 In other business, the 
commissioners distributed 
$61,808.99 from the Volun-
teer Fire Department Grant 
Assistance Fund to nine 
VFDs in the County, each 
one receiving $6,867.66. Re-
ceiving the funds are Central 
Bell County VFD, Southwest 
Bell County VFD, Moffat 

VFD, Morgan’s Point Resort 
VFD, Troy VFD, Rogers 
VFD, Holland VFD, Bartlett 
VFD and Little River VFD. 
Salado VFD did not receive 
any because of the recent 
formation of the Bell County 
Emergency Services District 
#1. Sparta VFD did not re-
ceive any of the local assis-
tance, but recently qualified 
for a grant for a new truck 
for the department.

Salado FD responded to FM 1670 for a report of a Resi-
dential Structure Fire. Crews arrived on scene to find a 
large grass fire that partially burned a storage barn and a 
vehicle. Due to the size of the fire and weather conditions 
at the time, the East Side Strike Team was activated. 
Central Bell County Fire Department , Sparta Fire Depart-
ment, Holland Fire Department, Temple Fire Department, 
Temple Med 25 and the Texas A&M Forest Service all re-
sponded to assist. The Bell County Fire Marshal was on 
scene to investigate the cause of the fire. The fire burned 
approximately 5 acres. (Photo Courtesy Salado VFD)

Bell Co. issues burn ban

	 Sirena Fest will be Oct. 
2 along Salado Creek. The 
mermaid parade was can-
celed but there will be a Pet 
Parade on the grounds of 
Barrow Brewing at 11 a.m.
	 Jennifer Abraham, owner 
of The Dog Spot in Salado, 
is organizing the Pet Parade. 
Awards will be given for 
Best Costumer, Largest Pet  
and Smallest Pet.  Follow Si-
rena Fest on social media for 
details. The Dog Spot has a 
link to the online pet parade 
registration form on their 
Facebook page.
	 Sirena Fest will run 10 
a.m.-5 p.m. Oct. 2 and will 

include educational booths, 
merfolk-themed arts extrav-
aganza and live music. 
	 Other highlights include, 
face painting, interactive 
arts activities, food and stilt 
walkers.
	 The goals of Sirena Fest 
are to highlight the legacy 
of Sirena in Salado, educate 
children on creek habitat and 
conservation, delight kids 
of all ages with the magic, 
whimsy, and artistry that 
the Village of Salado has 
to offer, and finally to raise 
money toward an All Abili-
ties Playground.  

Sirena Fest
on creek Oct. 2

Jingle Walk tix on sale 

Homecoming Royalty
Andrew Rocha and Kaitlyn Casper were crowned Homecoming King and Queen during 
halftime of the Salado Eagles football game against the Taylor Ducks. Salado won the 
game 59-6. (Photo by Royce Wiggin)

National Night Out Oct. 5
	 Salado residents are in-
vited to National Night Out 
beginning at 5:30 p.m. Oct. 5 
at The View at the Creek.
	 National Night Out will be 
a chance to meet the Salado 
Police Department officers 

and learn more about crime 
prevention programs in Sal-
ado. NNO is also a chance to 
meet your neighbors. Ham-
burgers, hot dogs  and cold 
drinks will be served during 
the event.
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Market & Economic
Update

By Jeffrey W. McClure
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	 The 18th-century En-
glish philosopher Jeremy 
Bentham came up with the 
idea of the panopticon, a 
prison designed to allow all 
the prisoners to be observed 
by one guard. 
	 What even Bentham 
couldn’t conceive of, de-
spite his creative musings 
about schemes of perpetual 
surveillance, was a society 
like contemporary Austra-
lia.
	 Heretofore an hon-
orable member of the 
Free World, Australia has 
lurched into a bizarre and 
disturbing netherworld of 
bureaucratic oppression in 
the name of public health.
	 Australia’s COVID-19 
lockdown mania has been 
so all-consuming that one 
assumes much of it would 
make Dr. Anthony Fauci 
blanch.
	 At the start of the pan-
demi	 c, Australia de-
termined to squeeze out 
COVID with lockdowns 
and travel restrictions, and 
as an island nation, had con-
siderable success. It was the 
last of the G-20 countries to 
hit 1,000 total coronavirus 
deaths. 
	 But this created an 
unrealistic expectation 
that Australia could have 
COVID-zero as a goal for 
the duration and use target-
ed restrictions and surveil-
lance (“circuit-breakers”) to 
maintain it. 
	 As the pandemic has 
dragged on, this has be-
come completely untenable 
and done violence to liber-
ty and common sense in a 
great English-speaking na-
tion. 
	 Lockdowns have cut a 
swath through the norms 
and conventions of an ad-
vanced Western democra-
cy, from the suspension of 
a state-level parliament to 
the banning of protests, to 

military enforcement of the 
COVID-19 protocols. 
	 With the Delta surge, 
more than half of Austra-
lians are locked down, often 
in response to a tiny number 
of cases. 
	 Australian authorities 
don’t 	 fool around. State 
premiers have vast pow-
ers and use them. In Mel-
bourne, located in the state 
of Victoria, a curfew is in 
place and limits apply to 
people leaving their homes. 
There are hefty fines for 
noncompliance. 
	 The spirit of the lock-
downs was perfectly cap-
tured a few months ago 
by the chief health officer 
of New South Wales who 
warned, “Whilst it is in 
human nature to engage in 
conversation with others, 
to be friendly, unfortunate-
ly this is not the time to do 
that.”
	 Ah, yes, the public 
health threat of over-chatti-
ness.
	 The Australian news 
media might as well be an 
arm of the public health 
bureaucracy and produces 
stilted and hysterical re-
ports about lockdown viola-
tors worthy of some dysto-
pian future.
	 South Australia has de-
veloped an app to enforce 
home quarantines. As a 
news report explains, “The 
app will contact people at 
random asking them to pro-
vide proof of their location 
within 15 minutes.” If they 
fail to do so, the health de-
partment will notify the po-

lice, who will send officers 
to check on the possible 
malefactor. 
	 Unrestricted travel is a 
hallmark of a free society, 
but Australians can barely 
leave the country. Travel 
has been cut off between 
states, creating an arbitrary 
patchwork of states trying 
to isolate themselves from 
coronavirus cases else-
where. 
	 Tens of thousands 
of Australians have been 
trapped overseas, unable to 
come back home because of 
monthly limits on returning 
Australians. 
	 All of this economic 
and social disruption and 
coercion hasn’t been enough 
to stamp out the Delta vari-
ant, which is outrunning the 
government controls. 
	 Australian Prime Min-
ister Scott Morrison finally 
admitted the obvious, “This 
is not a sustainable way to 
live in this country.”
Australia initially fumbled 
its vaccination effort, which 
should have been a focus all 
along. But now the country 
hopes jabbing 80% of the 
population can get it out of 
the lockdown box of its own 
making. 
	 The coronavirus is a se-
rious illness, and no coun-
try has gotten everything 
right. Australia has proven, 
though, that dispensing with 
key elements of advanced 
liberal society in the hopes 
of total victory over the vi-
rus is foolhardy and wrong.
Australia isn’t going to be-
come a dictatorship, but 
this period in its national 
life stands as a warning for 
how easily core freedoms 
can erode away in even a 
well-established democra-
cy.
	 Rich Lowry is editor 
of the National Review. 
(c) 2021 by King Features 
Synd., Inc.

A Western Society Goes Insane

 The Markets
 	 Intense angst marked the 
beginning of the week that 
marked the official end of 
summer and beginning of 
fall as the Chinese real es-
tate behemoth, Evergrande 
failed to meet an interest 
payment and looked like it 
might default on its $300 
billion in debt. That wor-
ry fell on top of fear that 
the Federal Reserve would 
move too soon and too fast 
to tighten the money supply, 
the approaching potential 
for a debt ceiling-related 
government shutdown, and 
the omnipresent threat of 
the Delta variant to derail 
global recovery. On Mon-
day, the S&P 500 Stock 
Index (SPX) fell to 4310, 
taking it down 5% from its 
high early in September. 
When the Fed did make its 
announcement, it was full 
of solid news indicating 
that the economy is growing 
nicely but was in no hurry 
to raise rates. A more care-
ful analysis of the risks as-
sociated with an Evergrande 
collapse revealed that, 
unlike the fall of Lehman 
Brothers 13 years ago, its 
linkage to other companies 
appears to be limited. That 
left only the COVID Delta 
variant and the extension of 
the debt ceiling on the table, 
and investors already had 
those calculated in, so in-
vestors flooded in to buy the 
now reduced-price shares 
and by the end of the week, 
the SPX stood at 4455.48, 
up 0.51% for the week. The 
Index remains 1.76% below 
its recent record but is up 
18.62% year-to-date. The 
CRSP Mid-Cap Value index 
closed at 2455.62, up 0.64% 
for the week and 19.67% for 
the year. 
 	 The yield on the U.S. 
Treasury 10-year note rose 
almost 6% to 1.454% as 
the bond market continued 
to signal better times ahead 
with a steepening curve. 
West Texas Intermediate 
crude oil rose 3% to $73.96 
on increasing demand, an-
other signal of a growing 
economy. 
 

The Economy
 	 The economic headlines 
for the week were centered 
on Evergrande, a Chinese 
real estate development 
company that was already in 
the position of paying early 
creditors with money taken 
from recent bond sales and 
loans. The deepest, and very 
real concern was that an Ev-
ergrande collapse signaled 
the Chinese were about to 
experience a credit market 
crash like that the rest of the 
world saw in 2008-2009. 
The results are not yet in, 
but the differences are ma-
jor. Evergrande had its new 
credit funding cut off as 
Chairman Xi determined 
that companies with too 
much debt could be loaned 
no more money. Given the 
government’s total control 
over bank lending and bond 
issuance there, that decision 
probably marked the end 
of Evergrande. Unlike the 
collapse of Lehman Broth-
ers in 2008, the Chinese 
government is prepared to 
step in and stop any serious 
negatives to their economy. 
At the reported direction of 
Chairman Xi, the govern-
ment is rapidly moving to 
take control of the various 
markets in China. This week 
too, all cryptocurrency pur-
chases were officially out-
lawed in China, as were any 
other cryptocurrency-relat-
ed activities. 
	 Across the economy, 
grocery shelves, new car 
lots, and appliance show-
rooms are showing signs of 
the nearly universal stress 
in supply chains. Domesti-
cally, General Mills warned 
that prices will go up as 
it must pay a premium to 
get the basic raw materials 
for its food products. The 
proximate culprit is a criti-
cal shortage of truck drivers 
as the Delta variant strikes 
hard at that group, where 

vaccination has reportedly 
remained very low. Fur-
ther afield, ports, factories, 
and transportation facilities 
in Asia are locked down. 
Since so much of what we 
want to buy here in the U.S. 
has at least some imported 
components, it is having an 
impact, slowing our rate of 
growth. For better or worse, 
we, as a nation, simply do 
not have the labor force or 
capability to make all the 
things we want to purchase. 
How long it will be before 
these COVID-related log-
jams resolve themselves 
remains an open question. 
Meanwhile, shortages and 
price increases appear to be 
our lot. 
 	 Buried in the back pag-
es was an item that in less 
exciting times would have 
made the headlines. The 
Conference Board comes 
out each month with its In-
dex of Leading Economic 
Indicators (LEI). The LEI 
Index was up “sharply” in 
August, fueled by increas-
es in nearly all the compo-
nents, rising 0.9%. For the 
trailing six-months the In-
dex rose at an annualized 
rate of 13.1%. The LEI 
functions much like a ba-
rometer. Major storms do 
not arrive without a fall in 
the barometer and, at least 
so far, serious economic 
downturns haven’t shown 
up without a warning de-
cline in the LEI. Supply 
chain disruptions and the 
threat of a government 
shutdown are very real, but 
the heart of our economy 
appears to be running with 
vigor and a great deal of 
momentum. 
 	 The bottom line remains 
much the same. We are ex-
periencing some significant 
bumps in the road to recov-
ery and expansion, but we 
are still on that road and 
making good progress.

Stress on supply chain
showing in lots, stores 

	 Microsoft announced 
recently that individuals us-
ing their various accounts 
won’t need to use pass-
words. Big bloomin’ deal! If 
you were underwhelmed by 
that declaration, you were 
probably aware that pass-
wordless access has been 
available for Microsoft’s 
corporate clients since 
March. 
	 More importantly, var-
ious competitors have of-
fered such features as fin-
gerprint recognition, facial 
recognition, odor recogni-
tion (best used with a dog), 
driverless cars (best used 
with a driver; they have a 
tendency to have accidents), 
and now cashierless gro-
cery stores where Amazon 
is making everyone happy 
(except cashiers and shop-
lifters). 
	 And speaking of mean-
ingless exercises, here’s 
another case in point: the 
California recall election 
scam (another redundancy), 
which was accompanied 
by the punditocracy filling 
the void with words, prov-
ing that Aristotle was right: 
“Nature abhors a vacuum.”
	 The outcome was never 
in doubt; Gov. Gavin New-
som was never in danger 
of losing. Registered Dem-
ocrats outnumber Repub-
licans 2 to 1 in California. 
Donald Trump lost Califor-
nia in 2020 by 30%. New-
som’s leading opponent, 
conservative radio host Lar-
ry Elder, was even more of a 
buffoon than Trump was in 
the state, and President Joe 
Biden got a lot of mileage 
out of it. “All of you know 
last year I got to run against 
the real Donald Trump.” He 
went on, “Well, this year, 
the leading Republican 
running for governor is the 
closest thing to a Trump 
clone that I have ever seen 

in your state.” 
	 Biden wouldn’t have 
said that if Trump or Elder 
was a threat to Newsom. He 
wouldn’t even have been out 
there if he didn’t expect that 
Gavin would wipe the floor 
with Larry, and the other 40 
odd opponents (and some 
of them were really odd), 
which he did. 
	 But pundits got to 
“puntificate,” and they did, 
both before and after it was 
over. “The key to this elec-
tion is turnout,” said the po-
litical experts. If Democrats 
were not going to turn out, 
there would have had to be a 
disease that wiped out only 
their party. And did anyone 
point out that if consultants 
specialized in turnout, they 
would be hired at exorbitant 
wages? I mean, how many 
would be employed if they 
said something like, “This 
is a slam dunk; the Dem-
ocrats have got this in the 
bag!”?
	 It got worse after the 
polls closed. Not only did 
Newsom lap the field by a 
30 point margin, but he au-
tomatically became one of 
“the mentionables,” mean-
ing he would be one of those 
mentioned if Democrats 
with presidential appeal 
were the topic of conversa-
tion. Of course, that line of 
thinking has limited appeal, 
because Joe Biden has a 
lock on the office -- until he 
doesn’t, if, say, something 
unpredictable were to hap-
pen. In which case the lock 
would switch to Kamala 
Harris, unless she pulled a 
Mike Pence. 

	 Pence was Donald 
Trump’s No. 1 bootlicker 
until the last moments of 
the administration, when 
he dared not do anything 
illegal, like telling a big 
lie about his power to sway 
Trump’s “big lie.” The 
Trumpster controls the par-
ty through intimidation, 
and the next presidential 
nomination is Trump’s if he 
wants it, unless he goes to 
jail or something.
	 Or the Democrats live 
down to their reputation of 
snatching defeat from the 
jaws of victory. Actually, 
it’s premature to talk presi-
dential politics since there’s 
a midterm election for 
control of Congress before 
then. If that goes bad for the 
Ds, it could open an entire 
can of worms. Although the 
worms have already turned 
with Afghanistan and 
the new surge in COVID, 
thanks to the Delta variant 
and the lack of patriotism 
on the part of anti-maskers 
and anti-vaxxers.
	 So the recall hyper-
bole will last as long as 
there’s nothing more for 
the self-serving pundits and 
candidates to exaggerate. 
	 Sen. Roy Blunt, Repub-
lican of Missouri, was quot-
ed in The Washington Post 
as saying, “I don’t think a 
recall election in California 
means much at all.” 
	 He’s probably got the 
password to this election, 
which was to pass. Sen. 
Blunt has chosen to do so 
and not to run next year.

Bob Franken is an Emmy 
Award-winning reporter 
who covered Washington 
for more than 20 years with 
CNN. (c) 2021 Bob Franken
Distributed by King Fea-
tures Syndicate, Inc.

Political Passwords
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Call Us, The Sooner the Better 
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  Jennifer Westbrook, EA (254) 947-1040
560 North Main • Suite 4 • Offices A & C

SaladoCPA@aol.com or SaladoTaxes@gmail.com

....serving those who love and remember

949 West Village Road, Salado
BroeckerFuneralHome.com (254) 947-0066

477 Thomas Arnold Road, Salado

CarusDental.com
254-947-8067

Ron Henderson, DDS
Dr. Henderson provides general dentistry services 

including: crowns, bridges, implants, fillings, 
root canals and dentures

Standing Cypress Fall Aster

Heartleaf Hibiscus GauraBeauty Berry Texas Orchid TreePurple Wine Cup

Plateau Goldeneye

Zizotes Milkweed

Elderberry Esperanza

  
Sunday, October 3, 2021 - 10:00a.m.

Barrow Brewing  108 Royal St. Salado, TX 

Blackfoot Daisy

                                 For a complete list of sale plants go to www.npsotcentx.org

Sponsored by NPSOT Tonkawa Chapter & Barrow Brewing

Texas Native Plant Sale

Joshua Luke Bingham

March 21, 1982
September 19, 2021
	 Joshua Luke Bingham, 
39, of Salado, passed away 
on Sunday, September 19, 
2021, at a Round Rock hos-
pital. 
	 A visitation for Josh was 
held on Saturday, Septem-
ber 25, 2021, from 10:30 
a.m. to noon at First Bap-
tist Church Salado. Funeral 
services followed visitation, 
with Pastor Adam Herod 
officiating. After services 
a procession was led by po-
lice escorts to Salado Cem-
etery in Salado. 
	 Joshua Luke Bingham 
was born on March 21, 
1982, in Waco, Texas. He 
is the oldest son of Luther 
Bingham and Diane Hill-
Smith. He graduated from 
Rockdale High School in 
2000 and his first summer 
after high school he bought 
an old boat with his dad. 
They worked together all 
summer to get it on the wa-
ter. That summer started a 
passion in Josh for work-
ing on boats. Josh met the 
love of his life, Randi on a 
Six Flags trip with a local 
school organization and 
she slipped him her phone 
number. Randi waited two 
weeks for his phone call 
and after that their love sto-
ry began. Soon after Josh 
decided to follow his dream 
and attend Marine Me-
chanics Institute in Florida. 
He proposed to her before 
he left, and they married 
on June 12, 2004. Togeth-
er they had two amazing 
children. After graduating 
from the Institute, he was 

hired as a mechanic at Tex-
as Boat World in Killeen 
and worked there for over 
twelve years and obtained 
every certification available 
to become a master boat 
mechanic. Josh decided to 
pursue his true dream and 
open his own boat dealer-
ship. He opened Bingham 
Marine Texas in Belton in 
May 2016. Bingham Ma-
rine was his life. He started 
it from the ground up and 
put all he had into making 
his dream come true. If he 
wasn’t fixing boats, he was 
driving boats, or involved 
in local tournaments to pro-
mote his business. He built 
so many meaningful rela-
tionships with his customers 
over the years they became 
more like family. Josh was 
an awesome boat mechanic, 
but he was an even better 
dad. He loved being a father 
and coaching his children 
in local sport leagues, tak-
ing them on the lake, and to 
local boating events in their 
Bingham Marine gear. They 
enjoyed camping with their 
dear friends the McCoin’s, 
the Olson’s and the Piatt’s. 
He always wanted his wife 
to achieve her goals and 
loved building their dreams 
together. He is missed 
so terribly by his family, 
friends, and community. If 
love and prayer alone could 
have healed him, he would 
still be with us today. His 
family is so thankful for the 
outpour of love and support. 
In lieu of flowers please 
make donations in his hon-
or to the Fishers Of Men 
Organization to Will Eller 
at 3329 CR 308 Caldwell, 
Texas 77836.
	 Josh is preceded in 
death by his grandparents, 
Rev. RA and Carolyn Hill, 
James and Noma Dee Bing-
ham, and Wesley and Vivi-
an Snow, his uncle, Michael 
Hill, father-in-law, Doc 
Stricker, his wife’s grand-
parents, CJ and Faye Rader.
	 He is survived by his 
wife, Randi Bingham of Sal-
ado; his father, Luther Bing-
ham of Belton; his mother, 
Diane Hill-Smith and her 
husband, Tyler Smith; his 

son, Luke Bingham (13) of 
Salado; his daughter, Reese 
Bingham (9) of Salado; his 
brother, David McCann and 
his wife, Sunny of Holland 
;his sister, Deanna Bingham 
of Kansas City, MS; his 
nieces, Annelise and Elo-
ra McCann of Holland; his 
grandmother, Ruth Hill of 
Temple,  his mother in law, 
Carrol McDougal and hus-
band, Michael of Salado; 
his father in-law, Randall 
Rader and his wife, Colleen 
of San Antonio, and many 
cherished family members 
and friends.
	 Arrangements are en-
trusted to Crotty Funeral 
Home & Cremation Ser-
vices of Belton of Belton.
Paid obituary
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Worship with us Sunday at 
10:30am just two miles west of 
Salado High School on FM 2484.

gracesalado.com/visit

ENCOUNTER GOD.
BE EQUIPPED WITH TRUTH.
ENGAGE THE WORLD.

gracesalado.com/visit

GRACE CHURCH           SALADO

MMeeeettss  oonn  SSuunnddaayyss  aatt  1100::0000  aamm  aatt  
tthhee  SSaallaaddoo  HHiigghh  SScchhooooll  CCaaffeetteerriiaa

Come as you are!

Pastor Billy Johnson......972-978-2239

Mass Schedule
Tuesday - 6 p.m. 

Wed & Thurs - 8:30 a.m.
Friday - Noon

Saturday - 5:30 p.m.
Confessions 4:30-5:15 p.m. 
or call for an appointment

Friday
Adoration (Holy Hour) 11 a.m.

Sunday
 (English) 9 a.m.
(Spanish) 11 a.m. 

Office Hours: Monday - Friday 
9 a.m. - Noon & 1:30 - 3 p.m.

601 FM 2268 
947-8037

www.saintstephenchurch.org

Religious Education
 Classes - Wednesday

 K thru 12th            5:30 - 8 p.m. 

St. Stephen
Catholic Church

947-5241 
IH-35 at Blacksmith Rd.

Sunday
Bible Classes • 9 a.m.

Worship • 10 a.m.
Spanish Worship - Call Church for times

Wednesday
Bible Classes • 6:30 p.m.

Salado Church of Christ
Come find out why our church family 

is driven by the same purpose Jesus 
gave to all his disciples – 

to love God completely, 
to love our neighbors 
(as we love ourselves), 

and to serve all the above. 
You are always welcome!

www.saladochurchofchrist.com

SUNDAYS at
Salado Holiday Inn Express

9 am Bible Interaction
10 am Worship
Continental Breakfast

www.saladocm.org

SALADO CREEK MINISTRIES

St. Joseph’s 
Episcopal Church

881 North Main Street
(254) 947-3160

s t j o s e p h @ s t j o s e p h s a l a d o . o r g 
S t J o s e p h S a l a d o . o r g

Sunday Service
 10 a.m.

(254) 947-7211(254) 947-7211
16258 Gooseneck Road,  Salado16258 Gooseneck Road,  Salado
www.3ccowboyfellowship.comwww.3ccowboyfellowship.com

Follow our events on our website calendarFollow our events on our website calendar

Church Services at Church Services at 
8:15 am & 10am8:15 am & 10am

(no mask required)(no mask required)

Presbyterian 
Church of Salado

A Friendly Small Church with a Message

Note: Based on the newest guidelines from CDC, 
the Church will allow fully vaccinated persons to 

attend worship without wearing masks.  Non-
vaccinated persons are asked to wear masks and to 

observe social distancing. (As of 5/16/21)

From the intersection of Main
Street and Salado Plaza Drive,

South to the first drive on the right.

Sunday: Services at 10:00 am
Men’s Prayer Breakfast at 8:00 am on Tuesdays
Chair Yoga - Tues. @ 1 pm & Thurs. @ 10:30 am

Rev. Carl Thompson, Pastor
105 Salado Plaza Drive • 254-947-8106
P.O. Box 865    www.presbsalado.org

254-308-2023

Sun.  morning services 10 am -11 am
Wed. night adult bible study 7 pm-8 pm
Wed. night youth group 6:30 pm -8 pm
Thurs. night young adult class ages 18-24 
6:30 pm 8 pm
Men's Prayer Breakfast 8:30 am 3rd Sat. 
each month

““CChhuurrcchh  iiss  nnoott  jjuusstt  aa  ppllaaccee  yyoouu  ggoo,,  
iitt’’ss  aa  ffaammiillyy  yyoouu  bbeelloonngg  ttoo””

9929 Lark Trail, Salado, Texas 76571
heritagecountrychurch@gmail.com

254-239-7106

(254) 947-5456 
210 S. Main St. 

 fbcsalado.org facebook.com/fbcsalado 

SUNDAY SCHEDULE 

          9:00 AM   Worship Service 
    10:30 AM   Sunday School (All Ages) 

 

WEDNESDAY SCHEDULE 

     5:45 PM    Children’s Bible Drill (4th - 6th grade) 

                      6:00 PM    Kingdom Kids (Kindergarten - 6th grade) 

                      6:00 PM    Student Midweek (7th - 12th grade) 

                      6:00 PM    Adult Bible Study 

                      7:00 PM    Choir Rehearsal 

        Call church office for additional information (254) 947-5456 

650 ROYAL ST. | (254) 947-5482 | OFFICE HRS: M-TH: 9 A.M.-4 P.M. |  F: 9: A.M.-1 P.M.

Sunday Morning Worship
9:00 a.m. | traditional worship

11:00 a.m. | band-led worship
sunday school at 10:00 a.m. for all ages

IN-PERSON 
BIBLE STUDIES, 

CHILDREN & YOUTH 
MINISTRIES, WEDNESDAY 

EVENING FELLOWSHIP 
MEALS & MUCH MORE 

NOW HAPPENING 
IN-PERSON! 

www.saladoumc.org SaladoUMC  Search “Salado UMC” (254) 947-5482

ONLINE 
WORSHIP 

CONTINUES!
SERVICES POSTED 

SUNDAY 
MORNINGS ON 
OUR WEBSITE & 

FACEBOOK

Mary L. Hodge
April 15, 1926
September 26, 2021

	 Mary Hodge was born on 
April 15, 1926 in Old Corn 
Hill, Texas. She died on 
September 26, 2021 at the 
age of 95. 
	 She was a southern lady 
growing up in the depres-
sion and through WWII in 
Jarrell, Texas. She loved 
her family and history. She 

was steadfast in her be-
lief of decency, honesty 
and character. She lived in 
an era of right and wrong. 
Her childhood was idyllic 
in the old school of Amer-
ica. Her parents were lov-
ing, and she had such great 
memories with friends and 
family from that time. She 
graduated from Jarrell High 
School and graduated from 
Business School in Austin, 
Texas. Due to living through 
WWII, her life was changed 
in many ways. She remem-
bered listening, at the age 
of 15, to the radio on a Sun-
day morning and hearing 
that Pearl Harbor had been 
bombed. Following that 
many friends enlisted and 
left Jarrell. Rationing then 
became the norm for her 
family. She had intentions 
to become a WASP and 
took flying lessons to join 
the Wasp Corp. That did not 

happen, but she wished it 
would have.
	 Mary married C. B 
Hodge on June 8, 1946 and 
moved to Salado, Texas.  
She worked with him in the 
grain business, sheep and 
cattle livestock order buying 
business, and land develop-
ment business in Salado. 
Together, they had a heart 
for Salado Youth which was 
demonstrated through the 
soccer and baseball fields in 
Salado and through the Bell 
County Youth Fair. She was 
a devoted grandmother and 
her grandchildren and great 
grandchildren loved her so 
much. She was known as 
Mimi even to all the grand-
childrens’ friends who came 
to her home often. She was 
a member of the Daughters 
of The American Revolu-
tion and Daughters of the 
Republic of Texas, and her 
family was included as the 
First Citizens of Texas. She 

was also a charter member 
of the Salado Chamber of 
Commerce Auxillary. In her 
later years, she wrote three 
history books about Bell 
County, Texas, Salado, Tex-
as (coauthored with Char-
lene Carson) and  Jarrell, 
Texas (coauthored with Pris-
cilla King). She was a mem-
ber of the Salado Methodist 
Church for 75 years starting 
in 1946. Also, her involve-
ment in the Salado Meth-
odist Monday Club and The 
United Methodist Women’s 
Club was extremely import-
ant to her.  She was a life-
time Christian and a prayer 
warrior for so many friends 
and family. She read her Bi-
ble and loved to spread the 
Word of Christ.
	 She is survived by her 
children Claude Hodge and 
wife Myrta of Salado, Glenn 
Hodge and wife Gloria of 
Salado, and Rita Zbranek 
and husband Randy of Sal-
ado. She is survived by 8 
grandchildren and 14 great 
grandchildren. She is pre-
ceded in death by her hus-
band, C. B. Hodge, her mom 
and dad, Fred and Eva Har-
rison, her sisters, Claudia 
Goode and Floy Johnson.
	 Pall Bearers will be Jus-
tin Hodge, Ryan Hodge, 
Barry Hodge, Joseph Con-
ley, Preston Conley and 
Randy Zbranek.
	 A heartfelt thank you to 
her niece Charlotte Vancil 
for her loving care during 
the last weeks of her life.
	 Services were held on 
Wednesday, September 29, 
2021 at 1 p.m. at Dossman 
Funeral Home in Belton.
	 Donations may be made 
to Outreach Missions at the 
Salado Methodist Church.
Paid Obituary
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Cowboys Bar-B-Q
Exit 285 • 1300 Robertson RD

Catering, Take Out or Dine In

254-947-5700 
Miguel Perez, owner

Slow Cooking
Fast Service

Gourmet Food & Coffee
Socks Socks & More Socks
Kitchen Towels & Mitts
Novelty Gifts & Souvenirs
Jewelry - New & Vintage
Bath & Body Products
Unique Purses & Bags

Gift Store
642A N Main St.

A Women’s Apparel Boutique
Fashionable clothes for curvy women S-3X

600 N Main Suite A | (512)975-8007
Mon/Thur/Fri 10-4pm Sat 10-5pm Sun 12-5pm

Facebook @TheRoseAndBeeSalado | Instagram @The.Rose.And.Bee

F O R  T H E  Q U E E N  I N  Y O U

a t  t h e  S t a g e c o a c ha t  t h e  S t a g e c o a c h

SOFI’SSOFI’S

4 0 1  S .  M a i n          ( 2 5 4 )  9 4 7 - 4 3 3 6

End of SummerEnd of Summer  SaleSale

TherapeuTic MassageTherapeuTic Massage

sound Therapysound Therapy

reiki & oTher reiki & oTher 
holisTic ModaliTiesholisTic ModaliTies

Salado Creek HealingSalado Creek Healing

McKenzie Reeve, LMT 254.308.0242McKenzie Reeve, LMT 254.308.0242
316 Royal/Cabin #7 By Appointment316 Royal/Cabin #7 By Appointment

Visit squareup.com/store/saladocreekhealingVisit squareup.com/store/saladocreekhealing
for info on Yoga, Group Classes & New Modalitiesfor info on Yoga, Group Classes & New Modalities

Mel's
Gourmet Delights & Pastries

100 N Church Street • (254)935-7080 
Tue 7:30-3 pm/ Wed,Thur,Fri, Sat 7:30-5 pm 

Closed Sun-Mon  melsgourmetdelights.com

Breakfast, Lunch,
Cakes, Pastries 
& other delights

Custom Orders
Catering

Limited seating guidelines
Dine in, take-out or delivery

Simple pleasures... Take time to indulge
Add-ons available - Order online now

www.inncreek.com/alexanders | 254-947-3828

and Chupacabra Kitchen

401 s main
corner of Royal and Main

LLive Music  
Thur | Fri | Sat

60 TX Craft Beers
on Tap

400+ Wines
Good Food

Burgers | Wings  
Soup | Salads
254.308.2220

254.308.2019 kitchen

Lunch 
Dinner

 Late Night 

Daily Specials

1 Royal Street    (254) 947-8840

sugarshacksalado.com
OPEN 10 - 6 DAILYOPEN 10 - 6 DAILY

Life is sweet
Life is sweet

COME TOGETHER IN 
THE HEART OF TEXAS

Event Spaces | Rooms & Suites
Pool | Dining

shadyvillahotel.com

@ShadyVillaHotel     416 S Main St.

	 Barrow Brewing Co. will 
celebrate three weekends of 
Oktoberfest on October 9, 
16, 23 and Barktoberfest on 
October 30.
	 Oktoberfest is an annual 
festival that originated in 
1810 in Munich, Germany. 
It originally marked the cel-
ebration of the marriage of 
the crown prince of Bavar-
ia, who later became King 
Louis I, to Princess Therese 
von Sachsen-Hildburghau-
sen.
	 It is celebrated in Texas 
in many German communi-
ties to recapture the Bavari-
an sense of gemütlichkeit—
cordiality. Beer goes a long 
way towards that, as does 
good German food and mu-
sic. 

	 The weekends of Okto-
berfest at Barrow Brewing 
will feature German food 
truck on the grounds, Stein 
holding, hammerschlagen 
competitions, a  Vendor 
markt and Live Music.
	 Performers  for Octo-
ber 9 include Rebecca Jane 
at noon and Mike and the 
Middletones at 3 p.m. Chris 
Peterson Trio, 5:30 p.m.; 
Deja Vibes, 8 p.m.
	 The Barrow Volks Ride 
will kick off the second Sat-
urday of Oktobfest on Octo-
ber 16. The Barrow Volks 
Ride is a ride for all cyclists 
with distances of 16 miles, 
50KM and 100KM and will 
take off and end at Barrow 
Brewing Co. on October 16.
	 To allow for social dis-
tancing, the Ride will be a 
Start-as-you-please begin-
ning at 8 a.m. and continu-
ing through 10 a.m. The 
routes will begin to close at 
2 p.m.
	 Routes for the Barrow 
Volks Ride will begin and 
end at Barrow Brewing Co. 
at 108 Royal Street. The 
50KM and 100KM fea-
ture more than 1,800 feet 
of climbing as cyclists will 
ride east of Salado on coun-
try roads to Holland and 
back.
	 Proceeds from the reg-
istration of riders benefit 
the Salado Volunteer Fire 
Department. Online regis-
tration of $60 per rider is 
available at bikereg.com. 
For more information, 
email barrowvolksride@
yahoo.com or call  512-810-
0611. Early registrants will 
be guaranteed a ride T-shirt. 
All rides will receive a pret-
zel and a drink at the end.
 	 Second weekend of Ok-
toberfest will feature a 
German food truck on the 
grounds, Stein holding, 
hammerschlagen competi-
tions, a  Vendor markt and 
Live Music and AmuricaTX 
Photobooth. Live music 
performances will include 
these: 11 a.m. Rebecca Jane; 
1 p.m. Lori Beth Duo; 4:30 
p.m. Jolly Jankin String 
Band; 7 p.m. Bubba Col-
trane.
	 The third weekend of 
Oktoberfest at Barrow 
Brewing Co. will be Octo-
ber 23 include a German 
food truck on the grounds, 
Stein holding, hammer-
schlagen competitions, a  
Vendor markt and Live Mu-
sic. Performances include 
12 p.m. Rebecca Jane;  3 
p.m. Lori Beth and 7 p.m. 
David McD and the Blue-
grass Pals. 
	 Oktoberfest is going to 
the dogs on October 30! 
“Barktoberfest” (bring the 
weenie dogs and Shep-
herds!). Go ahead, bring all 
the dogs for this fun day. 
German food truck on the 
grounds, Vendor Market, 
AmuricaTX Photobooth 
and Bell County Animal 
Shelter. Dog costume con-
test at 5:30 p.m. Live music: 
12 p.m. Mike and the Mid-
dletones; 3 p.m. Rebecca 
Jane; 6 p.m. The Lost Proj-
ect.
	

Barrow Brewing presents
Oktoberfest & Barktoberfest

Get your liederhosen ready for Oktoberfest at Barrow 
Brewing Co. (Photo courtesy of Stephanie Thomas Photography)



Shopping Map of Salado
Map Legend

S	 Shopping
A	 Art and Galleries
L	 Lodging
D	 Dining and Drinks
V	 Venues & Sights
$	 Services
C	 Churches and Education

#	 Business Name	 Type
4	 St. Stephen Catholic Church	 C
	 254-947-8037
6	 Salado College Park	 V

	  254-947-5232
9	 Salado Museum	 V
	 254-947-5232
	 Salado Visitors Center	 $

	  254-947-8634
	 Salado Chamber of Commerce	 $

	  254-947-5040
	 Village of Salado Tourism Office	 $

	  254-947-8634
10	 Sofi’s	 S

	  254-947-4336
11	 Chupacabra Craft Beer and Winery	 D

	  (254) 308-2019
	 Chupacabra Kitchen	 D

	  (254) 308-2220
14	 Salado Glassworks	 A

	 254-947-0339
15	 Rio Salado Cocina y Cantina	 D

	  254-308-2044
16	 The Sugar Shack	 S/D

	  254-947-8840
17	 Barrow Brewing Co.	 D

	  254-947-3544
	 Happy Pizza

	  254-226-1684
21	 The Venue                   	 V
	 254-947-5554
	 Village Spa	 S
	 254-293-6600
22	 The Shed 	 D
	 254-947-1960
23	 Salado Creek Healing	 $

	  254-308-0242
24	 Tablerock	 V

	  254-947-9205
26	 Salado United Methodist Church	 C

	  254-947-5482
29	 Inn on the Creek	 L
	 254-947-5554
	 Alexanders Craft Cocktails & Kitchen	 D
	 254-947-3828
30	 First Baptist Church	 C		
	 254-947-546
31	 Fairway Mortgage	 $
	 254-947-3454
32	 First Texas Brokerage	 $
	 254-947-5577
34	 First Community Title	 $

	  254-947-8480
	 Farmer’s Insurance Zbranek Agency	 $
	  254-947-0995
40	 W.A. Pace Memorial Park 	 V

	  254-947-5060
41	 Susan Marie’s	 S
	  254-947-5239
49	 Lively Coffeehouse & Bistro	 D
	  254-947-3688
55	 Salado Family Dentistry	 $
	 254-947-5242
58	 The Shoppes on Main	 S
           The Marketplace Cafe	 D
	  254-947-0888
60	 Salado Creek Jewelry	 S

	  254-855-5538
62	 The Pizza Place	 D

	  254-947-0222
75	 Stage Stop Center
	 Angelic Herbs    	 $
	 254-947-1909 
	 Bruce Bolick, CPA	 $

	  254-718-7299
	 Salado Creek Dental	 $		
	 254-308-2027
	 Vista Real Estate	 $		
	 254-231-0209

76	 Salado Civic Center	 $
	  254-947-5479

81	 Salado Wine Seller and	 D
	 Salado Winery Co.

	 254-947-8011
82	 St. Joseph’s Episcopal Church	 C
	 254-947-3160
84	 Old Town Salado
	 The Flower Shop	 $
	 254-444-0277	
	 The Rose & Bee	 S

	 512-975-8000
 85	 Wild Texas Cowgirl	 S
	 512-201-9702	
	 Salado Post Office	 $
	  254-947-5322

86	 Bill Bartlett – Century 21	 $
	  254-947-5050

87	 The Personal Wealth Coach	 $          
	 254-947-1111
90	 Presbyterian Church of Salado	 C

	 254-308-2023
91	 Troy Smith Financial Services	 $

	 254-947-0376
92	 Salado Sculpture Garden	 A
96	 Salado Plaza
	 Ace Pest Control	 $
	 254-947-4222
	 Anytime Fitness Salado	 S

	  254-947-1063
	 Integrity Rehab	 $

	  254-699-3933
	 Salado’s Hair Shop	 $
	  254-421-5173

	 Salado Village Voice	 $
	  254-947-5321

97	 Brookshire Brothers	 S
	  254-947-8922

100	 Salado Public Library	 C
	  254-947-9191

110	 Mel’s Gourmet Delights & Pastry	 D
	  254-935-7080
113	 Salado Church of Christ	 C
	  254-947-5241

126	 Cowboy’s Barbecue	 D
	  254-947-5700

130	 Village Spirits	 S
	  254-947-7117

132	 Broecker Funeral Home	 $
	  254-947-0066
134	 The Dog Spot	 $
	 254-947-3647
135	 Carus Dental	 $

	  254-947-8067
136	 Salado Schools & Stadium	 C
	 Village Church of Salado	 C

	  972-978-2239
139	 Cedar Valley Baptist Church	 C

	  254-947-0148
Not Shown on the Shopping Map
	 3C Cowboy Fellowship 	 C

	  254-947-7211
	 Grace Church	 C

	  254-947-5917
	 Mill Creek Country Club	 V

	  254-947-5698
	 JD’s Truck Stop and Grill	 S/D

	  254-947-5228

Historical Markers in Salado

6.	 Salado Historic College Hill
8.	 Shady Villa Hotel (Stagecoach Inn)
8.	 Main Street Bridge
16.	 Barber-Berry Mercantile
23.	 The Baines House
24.	 Historic Dipping Vats

25.	 The A.J. Rose Mansion
26.	 Old Methodist Chapel
27. 	 Caskey-Hendricks House
28.  	Dr. McKie Place (Twelve Oaks)
29.	 Alexander’s Distillery
30.	 First Baptist Church
31.	 The Tyler House

35.	 Salado Masonic Lodge #296
45. 	 The Anderson House 
46	 Old Saloon
48.	 The Norton-Orgain House
50. 	 The Barton House
51.	 The Levi Tenney House
55. 	 The Armstrong Adams House

61. 	 Historic Lenticular Bridge
49.	 The Vickrey House
76.	 Boles-Aiken & Denman Cabins
77.	 The Robert B. Halley House
79.	 The Reed Cabin
100.	The Josiah Fowler House
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If you enjoy the Puzzle page,
 try our interactive crossword and 

sudoku puzzles online at:
saladovillagevoice.com

1. GEOGRAPHY: What is the second 
largest island in the Hawaiian Islands?

2. TELEVISION: Which popular 
1980s-90s sitcom featured characters 
named Sophia, Dorothy, Rose and 
Blanche?

3. HISTORY: Which country hosted 
the first Olympics?

4. MUSIC: How many Afri-
can-American singer/songwriters have 
won a Grammy for Album of the Year?

5. MOVIES: Which 1990s film fea-
tured a twist contest at a restaurant 
called Jack Rabbit Slim’s?

6. COMICS: What was the name of 
the Daily Planet editor in “Superman” 
comics?

7. CHEMISTRY: Which English 
chemist is credited with discovering 
hydrogen?

8. LITERATURE: Hamlet (Shake-
speare) was the prince of which country?

9. GAMES: How thick is a puck used 
in the National Hockey League?

10. ANIMAL KINGDOM: What 
kind of animal is used to hunt truffles?

Answers
1. Maui
2. “The Golden Girls”
3. Greece, in 1896
4. Ten in the history of the awards. 

Stevie Wonder was the first in 1974.
5. “Pulp Fiction”
6. Perry White
7. Henry Cavendish
8. Denmark
9. 1 inch
10. Pigs

© 2021 King Features Synd., Inc.
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CAUTION PAYS DIVIDENDS

When planning the play of a hand, 
declarer should always ask himself 
what, if anything, can beat him. If a 
threat is found to exist, countermea-
sures should be sought to neutralize 
the potential danger.

Take this case where a casual 
approach to the play of four hearts 
will very quickly lead to down one. 
If, for example, South wins West’s 
club lead in dummy and leads a heart, 
the contract is doomed. West takes 
the ten with the queen (or the king 

with the ace) and leads a second club. 
When declarer next leads another 
heart, West wins, puts East in with the 
ace of spades and ruffs the club return 
for the setting trick.

While it is true that it takes an 
unlucky lie of the opposing cards to 
defeat four hearts, South should nev-
ertheless make the contract. Since 
the only way he can be beaten is if 
the opponents score a club ruff in 
addition to the A-Q of hearts and ace 
of spades, all his efforts should be 
directed to defusing that threat.

The proper play is to lead a spade 
rather than a trump at trick two, con-
tinuing with a second spade if the first 
one is refused. In the actual case, East 
wins with the ace but cannot subse-
quently regain the lead to give West 
a club ruff, and the contract is made.

The beauty of the spade play at 
trick two is that declarer cannot lose 
more than three tricks, despite West’s 
doubleton club, no matter where the 
missing aces and the heart queen are 
actually located.

If, say, East happens to have the ace 
of hearts, South will still prevail. In 
that case, after the spade ace is taken 
by either opponent and a club is con-
tinued, declarer wins in dummy and 
leads a heart. East can rise with the 
ace and give his partner a club ruff, 
but that’s all for the defense. South 
can win any return, draw the one 
missing trump and claim the rest of 
the tricks.

©2021 King Features Syndicate Inc.
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(254) 947-1960
Corner of Royal Street & 

Center Circle (West)

 OPEN
Wed  Sat 11-9 pm

Sun 11-5 pm
closed Mon & Tues 

BEER -Burgers
Pulled Pork 

Wings / Salads
Nachos & 

MORE

Monday thru Saturday     10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

(254) 947-7117
 1109 W. Village RD (behind Sonic)                            

Liquor Store

Monday thru Saturday     10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

(254) 947-7117
 1109 W. Village RD (behind Sonic)                            

Liquor Store

Monday thru Saturday     10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

(254) 947-7117
 1109 W. Village RD (behind Sonic)                            

Liquor Store

Monday thru Saturday     10 a.m. to 9 p.m.

(254) 947-7117
 1109 W. Village RD (behind Sonic)                            

Liquor Store

We have your We have your 
essentialsessentials

Mondays		
	 Bikes & Brews, 6 p.m. at 
Barrow Brewing.
	 Floor practice at Salado 
Masonic Lodge #296, 95 S. 
Church St., 6:30 p.m. except 
on Stated Meeting nights.
	 Open Mic Night every 
Monday at Chupacabra, 7 p.m.

106 North Main Street

(254) 855-5538 Private Showings

Tuesdays
	 Tuesday Night Prix Fixe at 
Alexander’s Craft Cocktails 
+ Kitchen. $14.95 for entree, 
dessert and glass of wine. Prix 
Fixe menu changes weekly. 
Visit Alexander’s Facebook 
page for weekly updates on 
Prix Fixe.
	 Trivia with Rockin Rick, 

every Tuesday at Chupacabra, 
7 p.m.
Wednesdays
	 Walking Book Club meets 
at Salado Public Library, 
walks to Lively’s for coffee and 
discussion and walks back, 10 
a.m. 
	 Guest food truck day at 
Barrow Brewing Co., 108 

Royal St. 4-9 p.m.
	 Tastes of the World at The 
Barton House Restaurant, 
5-9 p.m. Menu changes each 
week. Call 254-947-0441 for 
more information.
	 Wine Down Wednesday 
at Alexander’s Craft Cock-
tails & Kitchen, 5-7 p.m., Half 
price on select bottles of wine,  
featured wine by the glass 
and feature cocktail specials 
change weekly.
	 Karaoke with Rockin Rick, 
every Wednesday, 7 p.m. at 
Chupacabra.
Thursdays
	 Vinyl Nite with Shannon at 
Barrow Brewing Co., 5 p.m.
	 Teen Writing Group, Sala-
do Public Library, 6 p.m.
	 Dungeons & Dragons 
group for adults at Salado Pub-
lic Library, 6 p.m. 
	 Bikes & Brews, 6:30 p.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co.
	 Run4Beer Group, 6:30 
p.m., Barrow Brewing Co.
	 Family Night at The Shed, 
specials on beer and pizzas 
change every week. 
Fridays
	 Storytime with Ms. April, 
Salado Public Library, 11 a.m. 
	 Teen Dungeons & Dragons 
group, 6 p.m., at Salado Public 
Library.
	 Live Music at Chupacabra 
Craft Beers, 7 p.m.
	 Live Music at Barrow 
Brewing Co.  8 p.m.
Fridays-Sundays
	 All Day Gourmet food 
tasting, Wild Texas Cowgirl, 
642A N. Main St., Blue & 
White House. Open late Fri 
& Sat! @WildTexasCowgirl– 
Google Us!
Saturdays
	 Farmers Market at Barrow 
Brewing Co. 9 a.m.-1 p.m. on 
the grounds.
	 Live Music at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer and Kitchen, 8 p.m.
	 Live Music at Barrow 
Brewing Co., 8 p.m.

Now Through October
	 Pumpkin Patch on the 
grounds of Fletcher’s Books 
and  St. Joseph’s Episcopal 
Church. Join this Salado fam-
ily tradition every October. 
Have your picture made and 
purchase a pumpkin (or sever-
al!) to take home to carve for 
Halloween hauntings! Pro-
ceeds benefit St. Joseph Epis-
copal Church.
September 25-October 2
	 Salado Fall Sweep and Tex-
as Trash-Off Week sponsored 
by Keep Salado Beautiful. Pick 
up kits 8:30 a.m. to noon Sept. 
25 at the Salado Civic Center 
located at 601 N. Main Street. 
Drop off your used electronics 
for the Salado High School 
Robotics Team at the Civic 
Center on Saturday Sep 25. 
Eagle Disposal will provide 
dumpsters in the parking lot 
of the Civic Center where vol-
unteers can deposit their bags 
of collected litter and recycla-
ble goods anytime during the 
week. 
September 26
	 Barrow Brewing Co., live 
music at 4 p.m. Eric Turner. 
October 2
	 Sirena Fest, Creekside, 
10:30 a.m.-5 p.m. benefiting 
All Abilities Playground at 
Pace Park. Pet parade at 11 
a.m. on the grounds of Barrow 
Brewing Co.
October 1
	 Special Called Meeting 
of Salado Community Foun-
dation, 1 p.m., Salado Civic 
Center. Speaker will be Ashley 
Allison,  Executive Director 
of Waco Foundation.She will 
speak on Foundation 101, legal 
responsibility of Foundation 
and answer a variety of ques-
tions concerning community 
foundations.
October 1
	 Live Music at Chupacabra, 
8 p.m., David Harness.

October 2
	 The Clothes Closet at 
Heart and Hands Ministries 
will be open 9-11 a.m., 213 
Mill Creek Drive, Suite 135.
October 2
	 Salado Youth Fair Boosters 
Reverse Raff le and Dinner, 
Tenroc Ranch. Dinner at 6 
p.m. 
October 2
	 Ribbon cutting for the 
Monarch Waystation at the 
Northbound Rest Area south 
of Salado, 2 p.m. Native Plant 
Society of Texas Tonkawa 
Chapter, working with Texas 
Department of Transporta-
tion, has built a Waystation for 
migrating Monarch Butter-
f lies at the rest area.
October 2
	 Live Music at Barrow 
Brewing, 7 p.m., Anna Lar-
son.
October 2
	 Live Music at Chupacabra, 
8 p.m. Dustin Simmons. 
October 3
	 Plant sale begins 10 a.m. 
at Barrow Brewing Co., 108 
Royal St., benefiting Native 
Plant Society of Texas Tonka-
wa Chapter. 
October 3
	 Live Music at Barrow 
Brewing, 4 p.m. Nate Guthrie
October 4
	 Ribbon cutting for Shady 
Villa Hotel, 5:30 p.m.
October 5
	 National Night Out, 5:30 
p.m., The View at the Creek. 
Come and meet the Salado 
Police Department officers, 
enjoy hot dogs and hamburg-
ers and cold drinks and learn 
more about crime prevention 
programs in Salado.
October 7
	 Pint Night at Chupacabra 
Craft Beer, 4 p.m.-midnight. 
Get a free pint glass with every 
purchase of the featured brew-
ery, Wild Acre.
October 7
	 True Crime Book Club, 6 
p.m., Salado Public Library.
October 8
	 Live Music at Barrow 
Brewing, 7 p.m.. Wes Perry-
man. 
October 8
	 Live Music at Chupacabra, 
8 p.m., Josh Jaccard.
October 8 & 9
	 Twenty-three stores along 
Salado’s Magic Mile are par-
ticipating this year. Visiting 
each store on the passport en-
titles the participant to receive 
a gift with an opportunity to 
win a raff le gift if one visits 
all 23 stores. Tickets are avail-
able at centraltexastickets.com 
for $25. Stop by Civic Center 
on Oct. 8 and 9 to receive a 
Passport, showing where all 
the stores are located. Friday: 
noon-7 p.m.; Saturday: 10 
a.m.-4 p.m.
October 9
	 Heart and Hands Minis-
tries food distribution to those 
in need in the Salado, Hol-
land, Bartlett area,  9-11 a.m.  
It is located 213 Mill Creek 
Drive, Suite 135 in Salado Pla-
za shopping center.
October 9
	 Fall Gathering at the Gar-
den, 10 a.m. at Salado Com-
munity Garden, 601 N. Main 
St. on the gorunds of the Sal-
ado Civic Center. Pumpkins, 
gardening tips and informa-
tion about the Community 
Garden.
October 9
	 Tour of Gault site. Tickets 
are $10/person; kids 10 years 
and under are free.  All pro-
ceeds go to the Gault School 
of Archaeological Research.  
Registration is available on the 
museum website.  
October 9
	 Asana & Ales Yoga at Bar-
row Brewing Co., 108 Royal 
St., 10 a.m. (Tickets available 
online at www.barrowbrew-
ing.com/store)
October 9
	 Oktoberfest at Barrow 
Brewing Co., 108 Royal St. 
Featuring German food truck 
on the grounds, Stein hold-
ing, hammerschlagen com-
petitions, a  Vendor market 
and Live Music! Performers 
include Rebecca Jane at noon 
and Mike and the Middle-
tones at 3 p.m.; Chris Peterson 
Trio, 5:30 p.m.; Deja Vibes, 8 
p.m.
October 9
	 Live Music at Chupacabra, 
8 p.m., Kyle Mathis. 
October 10
	 St. Joseph’s Episcopal 
Church annual Blessing of the 
Pets, 1 p.m. on the grounds 
of St. Joseph’s, 881 N. Main 
St. Time for pet photographs 
among the Pumpkin Patch, 
blessing certificates and Saints 
cards.

Village of Salado Calendar of Events

21 North Main in the Salado Square (254) 947-3688

LIVELY
COFFEE
HOUSE
& 
BISTRO

Breakfast & Lunch
Sandwich • Soup • Salad 

Gourmet Coffee • Espresso • Smoothies
Homemade Breads & Bagels

M-F  7-2
Sat   7-4

Handcrafted Pizza  |  Wings  |  Sandwiches  |  Baked PastaHandcrafted Pizza  |  Wings  |  Sandwiches  |  Baked Pasta
Salad Bar  |  Beer on Tap  |  Hand Dipped Blue BellSalad Bar  |  Beer on Tap  |  Hand Dipped Blue Bell

PizzaPlaceSalado.com

947-0022
230 North Main Street

Tues - Sun 11 - 9

The Pizza PlaceThe Pizza Place

 Pickup   •   Dine-in  •  Delivery

Serving craft beer & community 
in the heart of Salado

108 Royal Street                   254-947-3544

Sun -Tue  Noon -  8 pm   
Wed-Thur Noon - 10 pm

Fri Noon-10:30  Sat 11-10:30

108 Royal Street 
call in order 

(254) 226-1684
see the menu

www.happypizzaco.com
Thur 4 - 9 pm | Fri-Sat  Noon - 9:30 pm | Sun Noon - 8 pm

Happy Pizza Family Favorites Fresh Salads

Susan Maries,
O F  S A L A D O

a n  u p s c a l e  w o m a n ’ s  b o u t i q u e

171 South Main Street • 254-947-5239 
susanmariesofsalado.com

dian malouf
made in the usa

TRUNK SHOW
October 4th - 10th

Hello Hello! Dian Malouf is in the house!!
Known for her bold silver jewelry, enlivened by gold, 

precious and semiprecious stones,  Dian Malouf’s 
work is instantly recognizable. Many pieces are 

one-of-a-kind prized by collectors.
Made in the USA circa 1986!
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104 Copper Lane, Jarrell  512-746-2333
105 Western Sky Trail, Jarrell 512-598-3900

4802 Moreland Drive, Georgetown 512-868-8300

KIDS’ ZONE  
Learning Center

NOW ENROLLING

CONSTRUCTIVE
LEARNING 

AHEAD

FAMILY-OWNED CHILDCARE CENTERS
SERVING AGES 0 TO 12 YEARS

CHILDREN ARE A GIFT FROM GOD -PSALM 127:3 

 Brookshire Brothers Brookshire Brothers
Floral Department 947-8922

Floral arrangementsFloral arrangements
Fresh BouquetsFresh Bouquets

BalloonsBalloons
Home DecorHome Decor

Salado  Daily Delivery
Temple & Belton
Funeral Homes only)

MENUMENU
Tossed Salad

EntreesEntrees
Chicken Fried Steak

Smoked Bacon Wrapped Chicken Thighs
Catfish

Country Pork Roast W/Onions
Choice of 2 SidesChoice of 2 Sides

Mashed Potatoes/Gravy,  Steak Fries, Creamed Spinach
Fried Cabbage, Green Beans, Pinto Beans

Dessert & Drink includedDessert & Drink included
Kids Menu Kids Menu 

1 Meat, 1 Veggie, Roll, Dessert, Drink

Sunday LunchSunday Lunch
$17 per person$17 per person

11a.m- 2:30 p.m. Oct. 311a.m- 2:30 p.m. Oct. 3
Large parties call for reservations 254-913-1795
Gratuity not included, 20% Gratuity for parties of 7 or more

Cash & Check Only

Summers Mill RetreatSummers Mill Retreat
7441 FM 1123, Belton

Catered by MC3

Salado Public LibrarySalado Public Library
October

(254) 947-9191(254) 947-9191

True Crime Book Club
October 7  | 6 p.m.

(first meeting)

To Go Bags Available
October 11 | First come first serve

Adult Evening Craft
October 14  | 5 p.m.

(new group)

Kids Pumpkin Decorating
October 20| 3:30 p.m.

Teens Haunted Terrariums
October 23 | 1 p.m.

SaladoLibrary.orgSaladoLibrary.org

Mon - Fri  10 am - 6 pm, Sat 10 am - 5 pmMon - Fri  10 am - 6 pm, Sat 10 am - 5 pm
1151 N Main St | (254)947-9191  1151 N Main St | (254)947-9191  

Facebook.com/SaladoPublicLibraryFacebook.com/SaladoPublicLibrary

Call the 
Salado Public Library

To sign up for 
October events

Come  See Come  See 
us at us at 

Sirena Fest!!Sirena Fest!!

By Tim Fleischer

Editor-in-Chief

	 Salado Eagles scored 
four touchdowns in the 
second quarter to put 
their homecoming contest 
against the Taylor Ducks 
out of reach, going on to 
win 59-6.
	 The Eagles defense 
gave up only 119 yards to-
tal offense while the slot T 
chewed up 493 yards of turf, 
466 on the ground as senior 
quarterback Hutton Haire 
handed off to five backs and 
carried the ball seven times 
himself.
	 Caden Strickland aver-
aged 13.8 yards per carry 
for 262 yards rushing on 19 
touches.
	 Aidan Wilson had 107 
yards on 13 carries for five 
touchdowns.
	 The Eagles scored on 
every possession, including 
the first, a 70-yard nine-
play drive capped by Strick-
land’s 3 yard run at 7:43 in 
the first. Daniel Chtay was 
perfect on the night with 
eight PAT kicks and a 31 
yard field goal late in the 
fourth.
	 The defense forced Tay-
lor to a three-and-out series 
and took over at the Ducks’ 
45 yard line. Five plays lat-
er Wilson took the ball over 
center for a 22 yard touch-
down with 3:46 in the first. 
Chtay made it 14-0.
	 The Ducks answered, 
scoring their only touch-
down on a 52-yard seven 
play drive with Jarvis An-
derson running in from the 
Eagles’ 2 yard line. The 
snap on the PAT kick was 
muffed and Taylor trailed 
14-6 with 59 seconds left in 
the first.
	 Salado drove 79 yards in 
the next series, with Strick-
land accounting for 49 
yards on the first play from 
scrimmage. He then added 
7 more yards before Wilson 
had two carries of 9 yards, 
scoring with 10:42 left in 
the first half. Chtay made it 
21-6.
	 Nic Bates intercepted 
Josh Mikulencak’s pass to 
give Salado the ball at the 
Taylor 28 yard line with 
9:06 left in the half. Haire 
hit Strickland for a 17 yard 
pass and then Strickland 
bulled to the 1 before Wil-
son dove in to score with 
7:49 left in the half. Chtay 
made it 28-6.
	 The Eagles defense took 
any wind left in the Ducks 
on the next series when Tay-
lor drove to the Salado’s 6 
yard line for a first and goal. 
Miller stopped Mikulencak 
at the 3 and Isaac Pettigrew 
stopped him at the 1 yard 
line to force third down. 
Darius Wilson broke up a 
low screen pass and Gar-
rett Combs met Jarvis An-
derson at the 1 yard line on 
a fourth down try, forcing 
the ball over on downs with 
4:31 left in the first half.
	 Haire got the ball for-
ward before Strickland went 
19 yards on a third down 
and then ate up the other 74 
yards on the next carry to 
score with 2:18 remaining 
in the half. Chtay made it 
35-6.
	 The Ducks fumbled the 
ensuing kick off, recovered 
by Nic Bates. Salado scored 
on a 2 yard run by Haire 

with 54 seconds remaining 
in the half to take a 42-6 
halftime lead.
	 The Eagles threatened to 
score early in the third after 
the defense forced Taylor to 
punt, but fumbled the ball 
over at the Duck 1 yard line.
	 Two plays later, Levi 
Thomas recovered a Miku-
lencak fumble at the 1 yard 
line. Wilson scored from 
the 2 yard line on a third 
down attempt. Chtay put 
Salado up 49-6 with 4:41 
left in the third.
	 After Salado kicked to 
Taylor, Blake Volk recov-
ered a Mikulencak fumble 
at the Duck’s 23 yard line.  
Wilson scored from there 
and Chtay made it 56-6 
with 3:37 left in the third.
	 Salado reserve players 
were able to  eat up almost 
eight minutes of clock be-
fore Chtay kicked a 31 yard 
field goal with 4:35 left in 
the game for the final lead 
of 59-6.
	 1	 2	 3	 4	 F
Sal	 7	 7	 0	 7	 21
Taylor	14	 28	 14	 3	 6

Sal	 Stat			   Taylor
28	 First Downs	 8
52-466	 Rushes-yards	 24-38
2-4-0	 Pass-comp-int	 7-12-1
27-0	 Pass yards-TDs	 81-0
5-40	 Penalties-yards	 3-10
2-1	 Fumbles-lost 	 5-3	
0	 Punts-avg.		 4-28.5	
Scoring Plays
Salado: Caden Strickland runs 
for 3 yards. Daniel Chtay PAT 
kick, 7:43 1st.
Salado: Aidan Wilson, 22 yard 
run. Chtay kick. 3:46 1st.
Taylor: Jarvis Anderson, 2 
yard run, PAT fail. 0:59 1st.
Salado: Wilson, 9 yard run, 
Chtay kick, 10:42 2nd.
Salado: Wilson, 1 yard run, 
Chtay kick, 7:49 2nd.
Salado: Strickland, 74 yard 
run, Chtay kick, 2:18 2nd.
Salado: Hutton Haire, 2 yard 
run, Chtay kick, 0:54 2nd.
Salado: Wilson, 2 yard run, 
Chtay kick, 4:41 3rd.
Salado: Wilson, 23 yard run, 
Chtay kick. 3:37 3rd.
Salado: Chtay 31 yard field 
goal, 4:35 4th.

See Eagles, Page 4C

Eagles score 4 TDs in 2nd 
quarter to put Taylor away

Caden Strickland goes up and secures a pass for the 
Eagles. (Photo by Royce Wiggin)
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WE BUY SCRAP GOLD & SILVER

108 E FM2410, Suite G  -  Harker Heights

Gold, Silver, Coins, Currency & Jewelry
(254) 699-2646

Locally Owned - Salado Resident

BUY    SELL   TRADE

Ace
Pest and Lawn

Locally Owned and Operated 
Licensed by the Structural Pest Control Board TPCL #12512

Customer 
Satisfaction 
Guaranteed

Free Estimates 947-4222

Good Luck from your ‘Home’ TeamGood Luck from your ‘Home’ Team

LASTOVICA
Fine Jewelers, Inc.

“Known for Service” 
Prompt In-Store Jewelry Repairs 

Diamond Sales • Custom Casting • Diamond 
Appraisal • Watch Repair • Diamond Setting 

Jewelry Repair
1202 S 31st St. & Ave. L • Temple

773-5772

Floral Design Service
Fresh Cut 

Premium Flowers 
Dried & Silk Flowers     

       Gift Baskets/Boxes
Gourmet Pocorn

 Slime, Christian Gifts
Herbal Bath Soaps/Salts 

Coffee/Tea Sets Fresh Fruit 
Western Deco  Shadow Boxes         

TheFlowerShopOldTownSalado.com
#9 Old Town Salado/602 Old Town Rd.  254-444-0277

Delivery Available

Douglas B. Willingham, D.D.S.
(254) 947-5242

SaladoFamilyDentistry.com

2 North Main Street at Thomas Arnold Road 
in the historic Armstrong Adams House c. 1868

Salado Family and Cosmetic Dentistry

Sara Yeager, Kim Newton 
Dr. Willingham, Cynthia Gandara

Preventive care for children and adults
Teeth whitening | Implant Restoration

Veneers & Cosmetic Crowns
Conscious & Full Sedation Dentistry Available

Dossman 
Funeral Home

2525 N. Main • Belton

IN SERVICE TO OUR FELLOW MAN

 933-2525
serving all of Bell County

DossmanFH.com

 Rita Zbranek 
 Your Local Farmers Agent    

40 S. MAIN ST.  
SALADO  ,   TX    76571  

RZBRANEK@FARMERSAGENT.COM 

   254.947.0995   

Call me today for 
a no-obligation 

quote!

254-771-1260
devereauxjewelers.com

1316 West Ave. M | Temple

Devereaux Jewelers
professional 
appraisal & 

repair 
services

Salado’s Salado’s 
Hair ShopHair Shop

(254) 421-5173
213 Mill Creek Dr., 

Suite 160
Gift Certificates 
make great gifts

Credit Cards Accepted

Full Service Salon

Howard W. Lufburrow, DDS, FAGD • www.lufdent.com
2004B South 57th Street, Temple

(254) 773-2197

LUFBURROW
DENTISTRY

Treating Bell County Smiles since 1994.

BUILDING ON THE LEGACY OF JUDE ARISCO, DDS

ASK US ABOUT OUR NEW 
MEMBERSHIP DISCOUNT PLAN

New Patient

Back to 
School

Comprehensive Exam 
and Necessary XRays

$99
($190-$400 Value)
Good until 9-30-21

	 Salado Varsity Lady 
Eagles jumped out on the 
Lady Ducks of Taylor Sept. 
24 and never let up as they 
cruised to a straight sets 
victory with scores of 25-
14, 25-15, 25-23. 
	 It was a welcome sight 
for the Red Posse to see the 
return of captain and four-
year letter, Lainey Taylor, 
but it was Sophomore OH 
Reese Rich that would lead 
the Lady Eagles. Rich was 
a problem for the Lady 
Ducks all afternoon as she 

enjoyed 12 kills and an ace. 
	 Close behind Rich was 
Taylor who swung her way 
to 11 kills and a stuff block 
from the right side. 
	 Defensively, Salado got 
phenomenal serve-receive 
out of Sara Ellis and Jordan 
Ferguson who paved the 
way for another big night 
from Setter Haleigh Wilk. 
Wilk amassed 36 assists and 
8 kills of her own in another 
big night. 

JV sweeps Taylor
	 Both the JV Red and the 

Lady Eagles volleyball teams sweep Taylor

Macy Morris attacks the 
Ducks at net.

Lainey Taylor sets the ball 
up.

Emma Grant plays the ball for Salado against Taylor.

JV White teams won com-
fortably in two sets.

Junior High Results
Reported by Coach Blair Hodges

	 The 7th B Team brought 
home another win last week. 
The Lady Eagles played 
hard and fast against the Jar-
rell Lady Cougars winning 
the first match 25-11 and 
the second 25-3. JuliAnn 
White was named player 
game. Her positive attitude 
and willingness to help the 
team in anyway does not go 
unnoticed. So proud of these 
girls, they are working so 
hard this year.
	 The 7th A Team started 
out slow against the Jarrell 
Lady Cougars but came on 
strong in the middle of the 
first set to win 25-20, 25-
18. The team rallied around 
great play at the net by Con-
lee Cox and great hustle and 
passing from Ava Uranga. 
Ava was named player of 
the game for her passes in 
serve receive and hustle 
on the back row as well as 
Mazzy Johnson for her at-
tacks at the net and assist 
when setting.

 	 The Lady Eagles 8th 
Grade A Team took down 
the Jarrell Cougars in 3 sets. 
The Lady Eagles won the 
first set, dropped the second, 
and won the 3rd 15-10. The 
Lady Eagles were led of-
fensively by Karlee Konarik 
and Haley Brown, while 
Shelby Dodge led the way 
for the defense. Player of 
the game: Karlee Konarik.
 	 The Lady Eagles 8th 
Grade B dominated their 
game this week on the road 
against the Jarrell Lady Cou-
gars, winning in two quick 
sets.  The Lady Eagles were 
led defensively by back row 
players Kensley Free and 
Regan Conner, contributing 
to the win with great passes 
in serve receive to help us 
have a great offensive game. 
The Lady Eagles were led 
offensively by Reese Franks 
and Mady Serna who were 
quick to attack at their posi-
tions.  Players of the game 
are Riley Guthrie and Emily 
Lemus for leading The Lady 
Eagles offensively at the 
service line with consistent 
servers. 

Sara Ellis in action. Haleigh Wilk in Salado’s 
3-0 win over Taylor.

Alex Dworaczyk gets the ball past a Duck. 
(photos by Royce Wiggin)
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JD's Travel Center

15881 South IH 35, Salado | (254) 947-522815881 South IH 35, Salado | (254) 947-5228

still lowest gas still lowest gas 
prices in Saladoprices in Salado

Check Out the SSPPEECCIIAALLSS
  1166oozz  RReedd  BBuullll  EEnneerrggyy  22//$$55..2299  

1100llbbss  BBaaggggeedd  IIccee  $$11..6699
  AAnnyy  SSiizzeedd  FFoouunnttaaiinn  DDrriinnkk  $$00..7799

Superintendent’s 
Corner
by Dr. Michael  Novotny

SALADO
40 N Main St, Salado, TX 76571
254.947.8480 Phone | 254.947.9480 Fax

By appt. only closing offices in Jarrell, 
Copperas Cove and Gatesville

Serving Bell, Coryell and Williamson Counties

Need room to roam?Need room to roam?

Tom H Trinh, DDS
General Dentist

No insurance? No problem! 
We offer an $89 special for your initial exam and 

x-rays, and all additional treatment is 20% off. 
Call today to book your appointment!

560 N Main St., Suite 3
 (254)308-2027 |  drtrinh@saladocreekdental.com

The Dog

Spot

Doggie Daycare & Hotel
Cat Condos
Grooming,

& Retail
Book now! (254)947-3647

saladodogspot.com
403 Thomas Arnold Rd

Doggie Daycare & Hotel |  Cat Condos | Grooming | Retail

Book now! (254)947-3647
saladodogspot.com | 403 Thomas Arnold Rd

The Dog

Spot

OFFICE: (254) 947-0376

101 Salado Plaza Drive
Sa lado,  Texas  76571

TROYLSMITH.COM

October 5
5:30 p.m. til ...
The View at the Creek

Hot Dogs • Hamburgers • Cold Drinks
Meet your Salado Police Officers and 

your neighbors and learn about 
local Crime Prevention efforts

	 Salado ISD school board 
member Jim Hodgin passed 
away on September 16, 
2021, after battling pan-
creatic cancer for several 
months.
	 Jim and his wife, Judy, 
have had three family mem-
bers graduate from Salado 
High School.  Their son, 
Tim, graduated from Sal-
ado High School in 2005 
and he now lives in Cali-
fornia.  Their grandson, 
Hunter Haas, graduated 
from Salado High School 
in 2019 and is attend-
ing Texas A&M – Corpus 
Christi.  Their grandson, 
Ryder Haas, graduated from 
Salado High School in 2021 
and is attending Texas Tech 
University.  They will have 
one more graduate of Salado 
High School in 2026 as their 

granddaughter, Lola Haas, 
is currently in 8th grade at 
Salado Middle School.
	 Jim was an amazing ser-
vant leader that did so much 
for his church, country, and 
community.  
	 Jim was a member of the 
Salado United Methodist 
Church.  He served as the 
Church Council Chair and 
led the effort to envision, 
plan, implement, and evalu-
ate the ministry of the con-
gregation.
	 Jim served as an infan-
tryman in the United States 
Army and was deployed 

multiple times to Germany, 
South Korea, and Australia.  
He retired as a Lieutenant 
Colonel after 23 years of 
service.
	 Jim served on the Sala-
do ISD school board since 
2018.  He served on the 
Planning and Zoning Com-
mittee for the Village of Sal-
ado.  He was also a member 
and former president of the 
Lions Club.
	 If success is based on 
what we do for others, Jim 
Hodgin was one of the most 
successful people I have 
ever known.

Remembering Jim Hodgin

	 Salado varsity cross 
country teams both won the 
1A-4A divisions of the Lake 
Belton Broncos Meet on 
Sept. 23.
	 The Lady Eagles were 
led by four freshmen run-
ners who cracked the top 10 
in a field of 63 runners from 
seven schools. Alexa Wil-
liams and Penelope Ander-
son took the top two places 
while Ally Ihler and Anna 
Redelsheimer also managed 
to crack the top 10.
	 Williams won the race, 
covering the two-mile 
course in 11:55.4, followed 
by Anderson at 12:03.6.
	 Ihler placed fifth with a 
time of 12:25.1, followed 
by Redelsheimer in seventh 
with a time of 12:31.1.
	 Junior Ida Boegsted 
rounded out the scoring for 
Salado with her 11th place 
finish of 12:35.6.
	 The girls scored 24 
points to win the meet. Lake 
Belton High School was 
second with 55 points and 
Lampasas was third with 90 
points.
	 Also running for the 
Lady Eagles were these: 
Natalie Burleson, 12:41.8, 
13th; Sydney Lange, 
12:44.0, 14th; Cassie Var-
gas, 12:51.2, 16th; Ellie 
Mescher, 13:03.2, 17th and 
Evelyn Wickert, 13:10.5, 
20th
Varsity Boys
	 Salado’s top five runners 
were all in the top 10 as the 
varsity Eagles cross coun-
try team scored 20 points to 
win the Lake Belton Meet.
	 Freshman runner Luke 
Anderson won the meet 
with a time of 17:16.3 over 
the three-mile course.
	 Isaac Huerta followed in 
fourth place with a time of 
17:39.0, edging out team-
mate Ryan Novotny in 
fifth place, with a time of 
17:40.1 and Owen Pitcock 
in sixth place with a time 
of 17:43.2. Brooks Dabney 
placed eighth with his time 
of 17:45.0.
	 Also running in the var-
sity race were these: Jake 
Rechtfertig, 18:20.3, 12th; 
Alex Hauck, 18:26.9, 13th; 
Luke Drigalla, 18:31.7, 
14th; Camden Aycock, 
18:40.8, 18th and Sean 
Murray, 18:49.4, 23rd.

 
JV Girls
	 Madyson Rosamond led 
the JV girls cross country 
team to the team title at the 
Belton Lake Meet with her 
first place run of 14:00.4.
	 The top five team run-
ners all placed in the top 
10 as Salado won the meet 
with a score of 21, followed 
by Lake Belton with a team 
score of 43.
	 Sofia Cadenas was sec-
ond in the meet with a time 
of 14:06.0, followed by 
Ashlyn Williams  in third 
place with a time of 14:08.8. 
Allyson Gouveia placed 
sixth with a time of 14:21.7 
and Addison King was ninth 
with a time of 14:38.50.
	 Also running for the JV 
girls were Sydney King, 
14th, 14:50.8; Evelyn Ack-

XC Teams win again!
erman, 18th, 15:16.4; Anna 
James, 20th, 15:20.2; Jolee 
Lindsey, 21st, 15:24.8; Ken-
nedy Anthony, 24th, 15:31.1 
and Payton Cunningham, 
25th, 15:35.3.

JV Boys
	 Salado JV boys com-
peted against 4A-6A teams, 
placing fourth in a field of  
10 teams and 52 runners.
	 Connor Lynch led the 
team with a fifth place time 
of 19:35.0. Also scoring 
for the JV boys were Jade 
Fields,  ninth, 19:53.7; Lo-
gan White, 10th, 20:04.0; 
Adan Giral, 11th, 20:09.2 
and Briton Messick, 12th, 
20:13.5.
	 Also running for the JV 
squad were Robert Joiner, 
14th, 20:34.10; Chance 
Heck, 27th, 21:37.3 and 
Casey Davis, 22:07.1.

NOW OFFERING

ADULT SPEECH

THERAPY IN SALADO!

213 Mill Creek Dr., #195

IntegrityRehab.net

254.699.3933

Varsity boys, girls runners dominate 
top 10 in 1A-4A Lake Belton meet
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THE PERSONAL WEALTH COACHTHE PERSONAL WEALTH COACH

947-1111 or 1-800-914-7526947-1111 or 1-800-914-7526

Jeffery W. McClure, CFP® Jacob A. McClure, CIMA®

www.thepersonalwealthcoach.comwww.thepersonalwealthcoach.com

Family Wealth ManagementFamily Wealth Management
An SEC Registered Investment AdviserAn SEC Registered Investment Adviser

P.O. Box 1029 | 918 N. Main St., Salado, Texas 76571P.O. Box 1029 | 918 N. Main St., Salado, Texas 76571

Objective Independent Investment AdviceObjective Independent Investment Advice
Highly Personalized Portfolio DesignHighly Personalized Portfolio Design
and Managementand Management
Listen to our radio show on KTEM 1400 AMListen to our radio show on KTEM 1400 AM
every Saturday from 10 till noonevery Saturday from 10 till noon

Serving Investors Since 1982Serving Investors Since 1982

Book Your Tee Time Today OPEN TO THE PUBLIC 

Mil lCreekGol f27.com
1610 C lub  C i r c le
(254)  947-5698

27 unforgettable holes of 
Golf designed by 

Robert Trent Jones, Jr.

OPEN TO THE PUBLICOPEN TO THE PUBLIC
Mon - Sun 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. Mon - Sun 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. 

  Dine In & Carry Out 
(254) 654-7885  

Dos HermanasDos Hermanas
Tex-Mex & AmericanTex-Mex & American

Practice Facility | Memberships Available

WWW.DONRINGLER.COM

Junior Varsity
	 Salado JV Eagles lost the 
Taylor Ducks 28-24 on their 
home field Sept. 23 to fall to 
2-3 on the year.
	 Salado led the game 16-6 
after the first. Taylor trailed 
24-12 at the half. The Ducks 
added a touchdown in both 
the third and fourth quarters 
and held Salado scoreless in 
the second half to win the 
game.
	 Tailback Nathan Johnson 
scored a touchdown on a 40 
yard run in the first quarter.
	 Fullback James Renick 
scored a touchdown on an 
eight yard run in the second 
quarter. 
	 Johnson scored his sec-
ond TD of the game on a 22 
yard TD in the second quar-
ter.
	 Johnson was named the 
Offensive Player of the 
Game.
	 Davis Graham was 
named the Defensive Player 
of the Game.

	 “We started the game 
great by getting points on 
the board,” Coach Dusty 
Youngblood said. “We 
fought to the very end and 
had a chance on the last 
player of the game to win. 
Looking forward to district 
play opening up in a couple 
of weeks.”

Ninth Grade
	 Salado ninth grade Ea-
gles fell to their counterparts 
from Taylor on the road 
21-8 on Sept. 23.
	 Taylor scored touch-
downs in the first, second 
and fourth quarters.
	 Brodie Landon scored 
the single touchdown for 
Salado on a six yard run.
	 Landon was named Out-
standing Offensive Player 
of the Game
	 Noah Romney was 
named the Defensive Player 
of the Game.

JV falls to Taylor Individual Stats
RUSHING:  Salado: Strick-
land, 19-262-2 TD; Wilson, 
13-107-5 TDs; Kase Maedgen, 
7-31; Haire, 7-31-1 TD; Dusty 
Rhiddlehoover, 4-12; Adam 
Benavides, 2-13. Taylor: Jarvis 
Anderson, 7-39-1 TD; Daniel 
Rieger, 2-12.
PASSING: Salado: Haire, 2-4-
27: Taylor: Mikulencak, 6-11-
69.
Receiving: Salado: Strickland, 
1-17; Wilson, 1-10; Taylor: An-
derson, 2-26; Connor Cobb, 
2-24; Rieger, 2-19.
Defensive Stats:
Nolan Miller, 5 Tackles (T), 3 
Assists (A); Jake Windham, 4 
Ts and 2 As;  Isaac Pettigrew, 4 
Ts; Dusty Rhiddlehoover, 4 Ts; 
Garrett Combos, 3 Ts, 2 As, 2 
Sacks; Josh Huckabee, 3 Ts, 1 
A; Jeff Bauser, 3 Ts; Nic Bates, 
2 Ts, 1 A, Fumble Recovery, 
Interception; Cavahn Wilson, 
1 T, 3 As, 0.5 Sack;Jesse Ma-
skunas, 1 T and Fumble Re-
covery; Braydon Sumners, 1 
T; Gavyn Keyser, 1 T; Blake 
Volk, 0.5 Sack, Fumble Recov-
ery.
	 The Eagles are 3-2 in 
non-district play and have 
the week off this week. They 
travel to Gatesville on Oct. 
8 to start District 9-4A play. 
Kick off is 7:30 p.m.

Eagles
FROM Page 1A

First Baptist Church holds
Community Fellowship and 
Food Event Sept. 26

photo by Royce Wiggin

photos by Royce Wiggin

Josh Huckabee ends a Taylor Duck point after attempt while Nolan Miller closes in.
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Shane LaCanne
(254) 654-4066

Homes w/Acreage 
available 300k+

 
½+ acre Lots 

Available 85k+

MarketplaceMarketplaceMarketplaceMarketplace
Page 1D  •  Salado Village Voice Classifieds: Deadline is noon Mondays  •  254.947.5321  •  September 30, 2021

Homes are selling!
When it is time to sell yours, give us a call. 
We have buyers looking for the following:

•  3 or 4 BR, in the $350,000 range
•  3 BR, 2 BA, $400,000 and under, with trees
•  4 BR with pool, $500,000 - $750,000
•  Homes on acreage
•  $600,000 and up, on wooded lot
•  $350,000 and below
•  Acreage listings of any size

4445 W. Amity,  Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$589,000

1847 Huey Drive, Belton
4 BR, 2 BA
$282,000

609 Ridgecrest Dr., Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$365,000

4505 Benvilio Dr.,Belton
3 BR, 2.5 BA

$299,900

2725 Winner’s Circle, Salado
3 BR, 2.5 BA

3016 Trinity Drive, Belton
3 BR, 2 BA
$349,000

10311 Orion Drive, Temple
4 BR, 2.5 BA

$349,900

907 Indian Tr., Salado
3 BR, 2 BA
$400,000

1114 Old Mill Rd, Salado
3 BR, 3 BA
$419,000

PPEENNDDIINNGG

PPEENNDDIINNGG

SSOOLLDD

PPEENNDDIINNGG

PPEENNDDIINNGG

PPEENNDDIINNGG

Auto Dent & 
Hail Repair
K E I T H ’ S  D E N T 
REPAIR in Salado. Auto Dent 
and Hail Repair. By appoint-
ment. (254) 681-HAIL (4245). 
keithsdentrepair.com
Child Care

Now Enrolling ages 
0 - 12. Kid’s Zone Learning 
Center with two locations in Jar-
rell and one in Georgetown. See 
our ad for phone and address 

info.	 tfnd
Salado United Meth-
odist Church Par-
ent’s Day Out currently 
enrolling students for Fall of 
2021.   Parent’s Day Out offers a 
Christ-centered curriculum that 
is theme-based and includes an 
excellent PreK 4 program. Our 
age-appropriate learning activi-
ties are chosen to lay a founda-
tion for understanding God, the 
Bible, self and family.  We teach 
language development, number 
concepts, pre-reading and pre-

math.  Parent’s Day Out meets 
Tuesday / Thursday, 8:00am – 
3:00 pm.  September - May. For 
more information email:
ttepera@saladoumc.org Learn 
more about Salado UMC PDO 
at:
http://www.saladoumc.org/com-
munity/parents-day-out
Cleaning

Clear View Window 
Cleaning: Windows, gut-
ters, powerwashing, ceiling fan 

cleaning. (254)931-6172.
Dirt/Stone Work

CBS Construction: 
septic tanks, house pads, drive-
ways, lot clearing, top soil, 254-
718-1752.  tfnd
Lone Star Grading, 
commercial, residential, indus-
trial excavation, grading, paving, 
pads, driveways, roads, 254-
947-0149 or 254-933-7900
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Britt Heating & Britt Heating & 
Air ConditioningAir Conditioning

 Installations • RepairsInstallations • Repairs
 Office 947-5263947-5263
 Mobile 760-1004760-1004
 Serving Salado for 25 years 
 TACL #B006640

Moffatt & Daughters Plumbing Co.
Rinnai authorized service provider RMP 17002

Bubba Moffatt

Time for your
TANKLESS WATER HEATER

Annual Service?

254 289-5986 (local)

Call Bubba Moffatt

CBS Construction

Gravel Driveways | Parking Lots
Septic Tanks | House Pads
Lot Clearing | Demolition

Chet Sutton, owner-operator

254 718-1752

222 W Veterans Memorial Blvd, Killeen 222 W Veterans Memorial Blvd, Killeen 
(254)833-4007(254)833-4007

Classifieds From, pg. 1D

(254) 317-7371 | svcremodeling.net

Kitchen & Bathroom | Home Additions  
Exterior Work | Commercial Work

Remodeling services in 
Salado, Belton, & Temple.

Financial

Bruce A. Bolick, CPA: 
Payroll, Individual and Business 
Taxes.  By appointment, (254) 
718-7299. SaladoCPA@aol.
com.           tfnd
The Personal Wealth 
Coach®:  SEC registered 
investment advisor, highly per-
sonalized portfolio design and 
management, 254-947-1111.
Troy L Smith Finan-
cial: Personal investment 
so lut ions.  254-947-0376, 
Troylsmith.com.

Florist

Brookshire Brothers 
full service florist. Blooming 
plants. 254-947-8922.
The Flower Shop #9 Old 
Town Salado at 602 Old Town 
Rd, 254-444-0277

Food & Drink
Alexander’s Craft 
Cocktails & Kitchen- 
254-947-3828. www.inncreek.
com/alexanders
Chupacabra Kitchen- 
Lunch, Dinner, Late Night, 401 
S. Main, Corner of Royal and 

Main. 254-208-2220.
Cowboys Bar-B-Q- Exit 
285 - 1300 Robertson Rd. 254-
947-5700.
Dos Hermanas at 
Mill Creek Country 
Club- Tex-Mex & Ameri-
can, Monday-Sunday 7 a.m.- 7 
p.m. 1610 Club Circle, Salado. 
(254)947-5698.
Happy Pizza - Happy 
Pizza, Family Favorites, Fresh 
Salads. Thurs 4-9 p.m., Fri.-
Sat. Noon- 9:30 p.m., Sun. 
Noon- 8 p.m. 108 Royal Street. 
(254)226-1684. www.happyp-
izzaco.com

M e l ’ s  G o u r m e t 
Delights & Pastries-  
Tuesday 7:30 a.m.- 3 p.m., 
Wed-Sat 7:30 a.m.- 5 p.m. 100 
N. Church Street 254-935-7080.
Rio Salado Cocina y 
Cantina-  109 Royal St., 
www.riosaladotexmex.com
Stagecoach Inn - Dine, 
Drink, Host, Stay. Takeout and 
Dine In- 254-947-5111. 416 S. 
Main Street.
Summers Mill Retreat 
- Sunday Lunch catered by 
MC3. 7441 FM 1123, Belton.  
254-913-1795.
The Pizza Place- 230 
North Main St. 254-947-0022. 
PizzaPlaceSalado.com
The Shed- Corner of Royal 
Street & Center Circle (west). 
254-947-1960.
All Day Gourmet Food 
Tasting & Wine Jelly at Wild 
Texas Cowgirl 642A N Main St. 
@WildTexasCowgirl -Google 
Us!
Free

FREE used  wine ship-
ping boxes available at Salado 
Winery 12-6 daily.  841 N Main 
St.

Garage, Auctions, 
Estate Sale
Moving Sale - Satur-
day Oct. 2, 9 a.m.- 3 p.m. 
408 O W Lowrey.
Garbage
Clawson Disposal: 
Competitive pricing for great 
garbage service; containers, 
too. 512-746-2000.
Health and Fitness

Anytime Fitness: 24 
hour access in Salado Plaza. 
Locally owned and operated 
254-947-1063
Angelic Herbs- Salado’s 
Natural Wellness Resource 
Since 1996, Independent Con-
sultant, open daily, 560 N. Main 
St., Suite 10., (254)947-1909
Carus Dental: General 
dentistry services. Dr. Ron Hen-
derson, DDS, 254-947-8067
Email: Crownhci@gmail.com
Family Dentistry: Lumi-
neers for straighter, whiter teeth. 
Douglas B. Willingham, DDS, 
254-947-5242
Salado Creek Dental- 
Tom H Trinh, DDS General 
Dentist, 560 N. Main St., Suite 
3., drtrinh@saladocreekdental.
com , (254)308-2027
Integrity: Rehab & 
Home Health Physical 
therapy, speech therapy, occu-
pational therapy, in-home skilled 
nursing. integrityrehab.net, 254-
699-3933.
Salado Creek Heal-
ing - Therapeutic massage, 
sound therapy, reiki and other 
holistic modalities by appoint-
ment. McKenzie Reeve, LMT 
254-308-0242
Heat & Air

Britt Heating & Air: 
Installation and repairs, 254-
760-1004, 254-947-5263, TACL 
#B006640
Help Wanted

Help Wanted Deliv-
ery Driver needed at The 
Flower Shop call 254-444-
0277.
Help Wanted- JD’s 
Travel Center. 15881 
South IH 35, Salado, (254)947-
5228. 
Experienced Baker 
needed. Must be able to 
make all kinds of bread. Flexible 
on hours, part time, midnight to 6 
a.m.  Call for working interview. 
254-935-7080   ftfn
Insurance

Rita Zbranek, Farmers 
Insurance, auto, home, life, 
commercial, 254-947-0995.

LONE STAR GRADING
& MATERIALS

COMMERCIAL            RESIDENTIAL
INDUSTRIAL

EXCAVATION • GRADING • SITE PREPARATION
YARDS • LOT CLEARING • PADS • ROADS

DRIVEWAYS • PARKING LOTS
ALL TYPES DIRT WORK • MATERIALS & HAULING

***FREE ESTIMATES***

(254) 947-0149 or (254) 933-7900

H 

WE 
BU Y

LAND
IF YOU HAVE OVER

40 ACRES
CALL US:

254.647.0242
WE PAY  

TOP DOLLAR 
FOR LAND!

Premier Land Investments | TREC Lic. # 9010387
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Dottie Shirley
REALTOR ®

254.721.9700
dottiejshirley@gmail.com

www.eFirstTexas.com

Window Washing Wonders
Professional Window Cleaning
and Power Washing Services
Gutter & Blinds Cleaning

WindowWashingWonders@gmail.com

Call or Text (281) 682-0142
office (254) 231 3289

Zack Tumlinson

Al Clawson Disposal, Inc. 
(512) 930-5490    •    www.ClawsonDisposal.com

ASK US ABOUT OUR SERVICES
Waste Pickup    •    Recycling    •    Roll-Off Containers

Salado Plumbing

947-5800

“We are ready”
In home repairs

 

Master LIC M 16892

Jewelers

Devereaux’s Jewel-
ers: Quality crafted custom 
work, jewelry repair, appraisals, 
watch repair, stone setting, 
diamond sales, photo design. 
254-771-1260.
Lastovica Jewel-
ers: in-store jewelry repairs, 
diamond sales, setting and 
appraisal, custom design, watch 
repair, 254-773-5772.
Salado Creek Jewel-
ers by Kiki Creations:  
106 North Main St. 254-855-
5538, private showings.
Landscaping, Home,
Lawnwork & Tree

Salado Landscap-
ing - residential landscaping, 
masonry and concrete services. 
Locally owned and operated 
(254) 247-7339.
Trees,  Shr ubs & 
Landscaping,  Pruning, 
www.victormareklandscaping.
com. Residence 254-527-
3822 or mobile 512-818-3822, 
Removal and Hauling. Flower 
beds, landscape design, yard 
work, top soil.  Serving Salado 
39 years, A+ BBB Rating. 

Personal Services

Salado’s Hair Shop, 
full service salon. Hair, Nails and 
Massage for the entire family. 
213 Mill Creek Dr. Suite 160. 
(254)421-5173. 
Pest Control

Ace Pest Control: Cus-
tomer satisfaction guaranteed, 
free estimates, TPCL #12512; 
David Preston. 254-947-4222
Plumbing

Moffat & Daughters 
Plumbing: Tankless 
Water heater Service, repair, 
remodeling, Rinnai authorized 
service provider.  254-289-5986  
(local) Master LIC # M017002
Salado Plumbing. 
In-home repairs, 254-947-5800. 
Master LIC M 16892
Real Estate 
Services 
Monteith Abstract & 
Title Company, Salado, 
experience, family, integrity. 
254-947-3922. tfnd
Fi r st  Community 
Title, branches in Salado, 
Temple, Killeen and Gatesville. 
40 N. Main Street, Salado 254-
947-8480.               tfnd

Classifieds From, pg. 2D

NOTICE OF ENACTMENT 
ORDINANCE NO. 2021-10 

 
An ordinance of the Village of Salado, Texas, adopting the Fiscal Year 2022 Operating Budget for 
the Village of Salado, Texas; declaring findings of fact; providing an effective date; providing a 
severability clause; and providing an open meetings clause.  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NOTICE OF ENACTMENT 
ORDINANCE NO. 2021-10 

 
An ordinance of the Village of Salado, Texas, adopting the Fiscal Year 2022 Operating Budget for 
the Village of Salado, Texas; declaring findings of fact; providing an effective date; providing a 
severability clause; and providing an open meetings clause.  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NOTICE OF ENACTMENT 
ORDINANCE NO. 2021-11 

 
An ordinance of the Village of Salado, Texas, setting a property (ad valorem) tax rate; approving the ad 
valorem tax rate and levy of $0.4953 per one hundred dollars ($100) of assessed valuation of all taxable 
property within the corporate limits of the Village for the 2021 Tax Year to help fund the Fiscal Year 2022 
Operating Budget for the Village of Salado; providing for an exemption on residence homesteads; 
providing for exemptions for individuals who are disabled or 65 years of age or older; providing for 
penalties and interest; providing for severability; providing for repealing conflict; providing for proper 
notice and meeting; providing for engrossment and enrollment; providing for notification to assessor; and 
providing for publication and effective date.    
 
 

 

 

 

NOTICE OF ENACTMENT 
ORDINANCE NO. 2021-09 

 
An ordinance of the Village of Salado, Texas to provide for the operation of all-terrain and utility-
terrain vehicles within the Village limits of the Village as provided in the Texas Transportation 
Code; and providing for the following:  findings of fact; reservation of rights; a savings clause; 
severability; repealer; effective date; and proper notice and meeting.  
 

 

Salado Homes avail-
able Entire Real Estate, 
Shane LaCanne. (254)654-
4066.
Rental/Lease

Commercial, Retail

Salado office for rent 
with IH 35 frontage; 1176 sq. ft., 
5 offices; kitchen; storage room 
and 1 BA.  Located at 1313 N. 
Stagecoach Dr., Salado, TX 
$1350/mo.  Mary Kite, Realtor 
254-718-2484. 7/16tfnb
Rental/Lease 
Residential

Charming, spacious, 
2/2/1 townhome for 
rent. Clean!! 6 closets, vaulted 
ceiling, w/d closet inside. Walk 
to shopping center. Lawn care 
provided. 254-913-9813, www.
saladorentals.com.
Property for Sale

Residential Sales 
9121 Bell Meadow 
Blvd- The home has approx 
4,000 sq ft living area including 4
bedroom 3 and half bath. This 
home features two master 
suites, one upstairs master 
with expansive views and one 
downstairs master with a large 
master walk-in closet. First 
Texas Brokerage, 254-947-
5577, $999,648.
LUXURY SALADO 
HOME! Thoroughly custom 
designed without a detail left 
untouched. Wake up every 
morning to the luxurious feel of 
a Spanish style estate! Escape 
to your very own backyard 
oasis and enjoy the resort style 
swimming pool complete with 
outdoor kitchen and fire pit. 
Tumbled Versailles travertine 
stone flooring throughout guides 
you through the open con-
cept Floor plan. The oversized 
kitchen full of custom cabinetry 
& high-end appliances can help 
you cook like a pro! Make your 
way into the generously spaced 
master suite with a great view, 
or relax in your master bath with 
a custom painted mural, heated 
floors, massive walk-in closet 
including floor to ceiling orga-
nization, soaking tub, double 
vanities & walk through shower! 
it’s safe to say you won’t want to 

leave. Each guest rom has a full 
baths attached, continuing the 
resort like feel! End your days 
in the media room complete with 
cozy fireplace & projector! A true 
must see! 1995 Cheyenne Pass 
, Salado. First Texas Brokerage 
254-947-5577, $389,900
1152 W FM 218 excellent 
hunting / weekend ranch or 
permanent homestead with over 
3,000 square foot home built in 
1976. First Texas Brokerage, 
254-947-5577, $995,900.
Services

Harker Heights Driv-
ing School- DPS 3rd party 
road test. No long waiting, 254-
680-4437.
Storage

StowAway Storage 
Household - Commercial 10X10 
- 10x20 - 22x40 Clean, lighted, 
fenced, Key punch entry. 947-
5502 or 721-1807              tfnb
Welding

McGregor Welding 
Supply, old fashion friendly 
service, Belton. We have all 
your welding needs. Sales and 
service. (254) 933-WELD
Veterinary, Pets, 
Livestock

The Dog Spot- Doggie 
daycare & hotel, cat condos, 
grooming, retail. Book now, Sal-
adodogspot.com , 403 Thomas 
Arnold Rd. (254)947-3647.

	 The annual migration of 
the Eastern North Ameri-
can monarch butterfly will 
be making its way through 
central Texas in the coming 
days. 	
	 According to the U.S. 
Forest Service, the mon-
arch is the only butterfly 
known to make a two-way 
migration as birds do. Un-
like other butterflies that 
can overwinter as larvae, 
pupae, or even as adults in 
some species, monarchs 
cannot survive the cold win-
ters of northern climates. 
Using environmental cues, 
the monarchs know when 
it is time to travel south for 
the winter. Monarchs use a 
combination of air currents 
and thermals to travel long 
distances. Some fly as far 
as 3,000 miles to reach their 
winter home. 
	 Eastern North American 
monarchs fly south using 
several flyways then merge 
into a single flyway in Cen-
tral Texas. These monarchs 
know the way to the over-
wintering sites even though 
this migrating generation 
has never before been to 
Mexico.
Congregation Sites
	 Monarchs only travel 
during the day and need to 
find a roost at night. Mon-
archs gather close togeth-
er during the cool autumn 
evenings. Roost sites are 
important to the monarch 
migration. Many of these 
locations are used year af-
ter year. Often pine, fir and 
cedar trees are chosen for 
roosting. These trees have 
thick canopies that mod-
erate the temperature and 

humidity at the roost site. 
In the mornings, monarchs 
bask in the sunlight to warm 
themselves.
	 The Tonkawa Chapter 
of the Native Plant Society 
of Texas, working with the 
Texas Department of Trans-
portation, has developed a 
Butterfly Waystation at the 
northbound rest area of I-35, 
just south of Salado. They 
invite you to a ribbon cut-
ting to open that Waystation 
for the Monarchs at 2 p.m. 
Oct. 2.
	 Also, the Tonkawa Chap-
ter will have a Native Plant 
Sale on the grounds of Bar-
row Brewing Co. beginning 
at 10 a.m. Oct. 3.
	 Among the plants for 
sale will be these: Sale 
Blackfoot Daisy, Calli-
lophus, Cedar Sage, Chili 
Pequin, Damianita, Deer 
Muhly, Elderberry, Esper-
anza, Fall Aster, Fall Obedi-
ent Plant, Flame Acanthus, 
Four Nerve Daisy, Fragrant 
Mimosa, Frog Fruit , Frost 
Weed , Gaura, Gay Feather,  
Golden Columbine, Green 
Milkwee, Gregg’s Blue 
Mist, Gulf Muhly, Hairy 
Lip Fern, Heart Leaf Hibis-
cus, Orchid Tree, Passion 
Vine, Pigeon Berry, Plateau 
Golden Eye, Purple Clem-
atis, Purple Wine Cup, Red 
Bud Tree, Rockrose, Salvia 
Greggii, Salvia Henry Duel-
berg, Skeleton Leaf Golden 
Eye, Standing Cypress, Su-
mac, Texas Betony,Texas 
Cup Grass, Texas Mulber-
ry Tree, Texas Sage, Turks 
Cap, White Mist Flower, 
Wright’s Skull Cap, Zexme-
nia, Zizotes Milkweed.

	

Monarchs migrate 
through central 
Texas to make
trip to Mexico

VILLAGE OF SALADO
JOB NOTICE

 
The Village of Salado is accepting applications for the position of Part-Time 
Administrative Assistant (Temporary). This part-time position performs duties 
including, but not limited to, administrative, clerical, and recordkeeping tasks 
essential to the operation of the Development Services, City Secretary and 
Municipal Court departments; greets and assists visitors including answering 
questions and finding requested information; and may be responsible for the 
collection of fees, deposits on a daily basis.  At this time, this is a temporary 
position.
 
Applicants must have a high school diploma or equivalent (GED) and possess 
a clear and val id Texas Driver’s License. Minimum of three (3) years progres-
sively responsible administrative experience required. Strong customer service 
skills required. The position pays $17.50 per hour. Appli cations can be ob-
tained online at www.saladotx.gov or at the Municipal Building located at 301 
N. Stagecoach. For additional information, please contact Village Administra-
tor Don Ferguson at 254.947.5060 or via email at dferguson@saladotx.gov. 
The Village of Salado is an equal opportunity employer.
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10280 Lark Trail

WELCOME TO THE EQUINE PROPERTY OF 
YOUR DREAMS. The features go on and on! 

$3,100,000

18110 Crows Ranch Road
Central Texas Hill Country living! This beautiful Hill Central Texas Hill Country living! This beautiful Hill 
Country property, with sloping terrain and multiple Country property, with sloping terrain and multiple 

groves of live oak trees, is the perfect setting to groves of live oak trees, is the perfect setting to 
build your new home.build your new home.

$725,000

TBD 50 Acres Fm 2268
DREAMY HILLTOP COUNTRY VIEWS ready for your 
forever home! Escape to the country, close enough to 

Hwy 95 I35, but far enough away to find peaceful views 
and room to spread out! 50 acres (to be surveyed out) for 

your dream homesite!
$1,000,000

12321 Eagle Nest Rd
Georgeous 10+ acres in Salado to build your dream 

home on! Pristine, native Hill Country pastures. 
Centrally located only minutes from charming 

Salado with great shopping, entertainment and 
excellent schools.

$299,900

805 Van Bibber Rd
Creekside Custom Homes delivers again! 

Absolutely beautiful home on over an acre near 
downtown Salado. This 4 bed/4 bath home with 3 

car garage is nestled off of Van Bibber, making it a 
golf cart ride to anywhere you’d want to be.

$699,000

21 N Main Street , A1
NOW AVAILABLE FOR LEASE! 1,895 sqft of premier NOW AVAILABLE FOR LEASE! 1,895 sqft of premier 
retail space located centrally in Salado. Main Street retail space located centrally in Salado. Main Street 

frontage with parking and side walks make this frontage with parking and side walks make this 
location impossible to miss!location impossible to miss!

  
$3,032$3,032

21 N Main Street , B2
NOW AVAILABLE FOR LEASE! 310 sqft of premier 
retail space located centrally in Salado. Courtyard 

access with lots of parking and side walks make this 
location ideal for your business! Neighboring tenants 

include retail shopping and dining.
$620

1517 Trails End
Come see this stunning home located on 4 + Hill Country 

acres with seasonal creek in Hidden Springs. Custom 
cabinetry and center island make this kitchen great for 
entertaining and hosting events, lots of counter space!

$1,450,000

NEIGHBORHOODS
Spring Creek - Salado’s newest neighborhood, West of town on FM2484 Beautiful 
hardwood trees. The peaceful spot you’ve been searching for to build your new home. 
Few miles out of Salado, a short drive from Belton, Harker Heights and Georgetown. 
Mill Creek Meadows - Dream home on a golf course? Whether you are a golfer or 
just enjoy overlooking a well-maintained course from your home, Mill Creek Mead-
ows is for you! Gated, community park within strolling distance of Mill Creek Golf 
Course and a golf cart ride away from Salado shopping and dining. 
Mystic River - Lots overlooking the Leon River. Neighborhood shaded by a 
canopy of Live Oak and Pecan trees, walk from your back door to your personal 
dock at the river bank. 

COMMERCIAL
7.695 acre Investment Property in Temple off South 31st 
ST, $649,900
1.979 acre 2801 S Interstate 35 Belton, TX 76513

ACREAGE
10 Acres along I-35 frontage, sewage available $1,750,000
25 Acres on the Leon River, Belton
5 Acres  2251 County Road 234 Georgetown, TX 78633
300 Acres 0000 CR 212 Coolidge, TX 76635
4.488  I-35 and Rose Lane
660 Acres  Rance CR 660acreranchcr30.com
50 Acres  Holland

GLENN HODGE
254-718-2000

LARRY WENTRCEK
254-718-5326

RESIDENTIAL     FARM & RANCH     COMMERCIAL
RYAN HODGE
254-541-2255

JERRY ROBERTS
254-760-6576

DOTTIE SHIRLEY
254-721-9700

TIA DOSKOCIL
254-718-9442

ALLAN PERSKY
254-760-2924

JOSH JACOBSEN
254-541-3319

Tonya Spears
512-633-8026

WICK THOMAS
254-718-1404

254-947-5577

80 S. Main Street Salado, Texas 254-947-5577
www.FirstTexas.com

 FARM & RANCH • COMMERCIAL

8469 Spring Creek Loop

Heres another absolute must see from S & G Ven-
tures in the coveted Spring Creek neighborhood.

$722,500

1687 Indian Pass

Welcome to your own personal resort, where you’ll 
feel like you’re on vacation everyday of the year!

$1,200,000

5785 S 31st
Great commercial site located in the bustling 
heart of Temple TX! Zoning is Neighborhood 

Services.
$650,000

5300 Bunny Trail
LOCATION LOCATION LOCATION is very im-

portant when it comes to YOUR BUSINESS! This 
Commercial property, currently zoned B-3, is 1.73 

acres and is directly across from Walmart.
$225,000

2200 Southbend Road
Looking for a half acre in Salado TX to build your 

dream home? Now is your chance! Located in 
South Shore subdivision just 15 minutes from 

downtown Salado and minutes away from Still-
house Lake.

$83,900

9420 Fm 2843
One of the most beautiful rolling hill ranches with 
large live oak trees, spring-fed creeks, and spring 

tanks with good bottomland and outstanding views.
https://dblebb-ranch.com/

SOLDSOLD

GIVE US A CALL!

Salado Fire Department Report Sept. 19-25
Date	 Address	  Incident Type
09/19/2021	 ANDRE LOOP, Bell County	 Hemorrhage / Laceration
09/19/2021	 PARK DR, Salado	 Unconscious / Fainting
09/19/2021	 FM 2484, Bell County 	 Difficulty Breathing
09/19/2021	 FM 2843, Bell County	 Grass Fire
09/19/2021	 CHISHOLM TRL, Salado	 False Alarm
09/19/2021	 ROSE LN, Bell County	 Stroke
09/19/2021	 ELM GROVE RD, Bell County	 Choking
09/19/2021	 INDIAN TRL, Salado	 Cooking Fire
09/19/2021	 ELM GROVE RD, Bell County	 Sick Person
09/20/2021	 HOMESTEAD RD, Bell County	 Convulsions / Seizures
09/20/2021	 FM 2268, Bell County	 Falls
09/20/2021	 INTERSTATE 35, Bell County	 Unknown Status - Man Down
09/20/2021	 INTERSTATE 35 SERVICE RD, Belton	 Outside Storage Fire
09/21/2021	 UNION GROVE PARK RD, Bell County	 Unconscious / Fainting
09/21/2021	 INTERSTATE 35 SERVICE RD, Bell County	 Stroke
09/21/2021	 COLLEGE HILL DR, Salado	 Chest Pain
09/22/2021	 FM 2843, Florence	 Grass Fire
09/22/2021	 STAGECOACH CIR, Salado	 Sick Person
09/23/2021	 TOMMY LOOP, Bell County	 Dispatched & Cancelled en route
09/23/2021	 ROLLING MEADOW DR, Bell County	 Smoke Detector Activation
09/23/2021	 LA PALOMA LOOP, Bell County	 Smoke Detector Activation
09/23/2021	 TOMMY LOOP, Bell County	 Headache
09/23/2021	 INTERSTATE 35, Bell County	 Nothing Found
09/25/2021	 INTERSTATE 35, Jarrell 	 Dispatched & Cancelled en route
09/25/2021	 SULPHUR WELLS RD, Bell County	 Unconscious / Fainting
09/25/2021	 OLD MILL RD, Salado	 Lift Assist
09/25/2021	 FM 1670, Bell County	 Grass / Outside Waste Fire
09/25/2021	 HAMLET DR, Bell County	 Difficulty Breathing
09/25/2021	 FM 1670, Bell County 	 Grass Fire
09/25/2021	 INTERSTATE 35, Belton 	 Motor Vehicle Accident with Injuries

OFFENSE/INCIDENT REPORTS:
09/20/2021:
	 An officer responded to the 
700 block of N. Stagecoach for 
a report of a theft/shoplifting.  
Upon arrival it was reported 
that a Hispanic male took two 
knives and exited the business 
without paying for them.  The 
owner approached the male in 
the parking lot and demanded 
he return the items, which he 
then paid for the knives and left 
without incident.  The owner of 
the business then noticed that 
another knife was missing and 
believed that the suspect took 
that knife as well since it was in 
the same area as the other two 
knives that were taken.  There 
have been no arrests at this 
time.
09/21/2021:
	 A report was filed with the 
police department in which 
the complainant alleges that 
another person who worked 
with a non-profit organization 

	 In addition to the 
above-mentioned calls, Sala-
do Police Officers handled the 
many other calls for service 
in which a report was not re-
quired.  Below is a breakdown 
of those calls:
 
Alarm Business	 0
Alarm Residential	 1
Animal Complaint	 5
Assist Another Agency	 3
Calls for Service	 48
Citations	 58
Citizen Contact	 6
Crash	 2
Flock Camera Hit	 1
Found Property	 1
Harassment	 1
House Watch/RU OK?	 33
Illegally Parked Vehicle	 2
Open Door	 2
Public Service	 14
Suspicious Person	 1
Theft	 1
Traffic Control	 1
Traffic Hazard	 1
Welfare Concern	 2

had taken money that belonged 
to the organization to use for 
personal matters.  This case is 
currently under investigation 
and no arrests have been made 
at this time.
	 An officer responded to the 
100 block of Royal in reference 
to several people smoking a il-
legal substance near the creek.  
Two females were found to be 
smoking marijuana near the 
creek.  The drug was seized as 
evidence and they received a 
citation for possession of drug 
paraphernalia due to the small 
amount of marijuana.  No ar-
rests were made. 
09/25/2021:
	 SPD responded to South-
bound IH 35 at exit 283 in ref-
erence to a hit and run report.  
The complainant reported that 
he was struck by another vehi-
cle, which caused him to lose 
control of his vehicle and crash.  
There is no suspect or vehicle 
description.

Salado Police Report Sept. 20-26


